

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
1	List A GServ	Febreze Air Effects/Air Refresher Spring Renewal or Fresh Linen fragrance, Proctor Gamble, 9.7 oz Aerosol, 9/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.96		NO BID	\$47.59	
												\$1,796.40				
2		Rochester Midland Proxi Spray Walk Away Stain Remover #RMG 11849315 or equal, 32 oz trigger spray bottle, 12/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.66		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$5.90	
		Case Count					12								12	
		Case Cost					\$79.90								\$70.77	
							\$239.70									
3		Disinfectant, Kaivac Inc KaiBosh, 1 gal, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	9	NO BID	NO BID	\$97.90		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$881.10									
4		KaiBlooley Restroom Cleaner, Kaivac Inc, 1 gal, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$96.40		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$82.15	NO BID	
														\$246.45		
5		Telescoping Handle #0000AM3040A or equal, for Filmop Folding Mop Holder, 38"-72", 10/cs	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.49		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.96	
		Case Count					10								10	
		Case Cost					\$24.90								\$9.55	
							\$373.50									
6		32" Dust Mop Holder w/ replaceable Velcro straps, Filmop #5278 or equal, 10/cs	CS	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.49		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$18.00	
		Case Count					10								1	
		Case Cost					\$74.90								\$18.00	
							\$898.80									
7		Squeegee, Unisan #UNS922-9 or equal, 21" handle, 8" head	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.95		NO BID	\$5.90	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$3.05	
										\$70.80						
8		Treated Dust Cloths, Chicopee #CHI 0911 or equal, 24"x24", 500/cs	CS	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.12	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.17	\$1.25	
		Case Count								500				500	50	
		Case Cost								\$57.60				\$85.65	\$62.52	
										\$691.20						

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
9		Vacuum Filter Intercept Microfilter #100431 or equal for Proteam DT100 Tailvac, 10/pk	PK	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$10.00 \$30.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
10		Vacuum Cleaner Bag, Neumatic #NVM2B or equal; for canister vacuum, 10/pk	PK	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$2.31 10 \$23.05 \$138.30	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$1.22 100 \$122.09	
11		Disposable Bags #801614 or equal, for Tidy Vac Canister Vacuum, 10/pk	PK	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.99 10 \$179.90		NO BID	\$1.16 10 \$11.60 \$139.20	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$1.36 100 \$136.14	
12		Magnetic Strip for commercial vacuum cleaner, Magnet Clean #MC-4 or equal, 11.5" width	EA	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.70		NO BID	\$9.00 \$135.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
13		Vacuum Belts for Tornado CV-30, Belt #K2884274, 12" upright vacuum cleaner, 10/pk (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	PK	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.99 10 \$89.90		NO BID	\$3.50 10 \$35.00 \$420.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
14		Disposable bags for Tornado CV-30, Bag #K6904294, 12" upright vacuum cleaner, 10/pk (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	PK	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.69 10 \$16.90		NO BID	\$1.27 10 \$12.70 \$190.50	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$1.93 100 \$193.36	
15		Bucket, Rubbermaid #2963 or equal, Brute bucket, 10 qt; round; gray	EA	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.95		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.89 \$8.67		NO BID	\$15.64	
16		Floor Sign, Rubbermaid #6277-77 or equal, multi-lingual "caution wet floor", imprinted on 4 sides, color: yellow, 6/cs	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.98 6 \$179.90		NO BID	NO BID	\$17.92 6 \$107.52	\$35.99 6 \$215.94	\$31.99 6 \$191.94	NO BID	\$41.47 1 \$41.47	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
											\$645.12					
17		34" Replacement Micro Fiber Dust Mop, Filmop #216DA or equal, 14/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$56.43		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$10.91	
		Case Count					14								12	
		Case Cost					\$790.00								\$130.93	
							\$2,370.00									
18		String Mop Hillyard #24327 or equal	EA	60	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.99		\$8.47	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$90.12	
							\$479.40									
19		Foam Filters #K69414/650 or equal for Tornado CV 30 12" (needs to fit in filter frame #K64147650) 3/pk	PK	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.90		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$539.40									
20		Motor intake filter for Tornado CV-30 12" upright vacuum cleaner, #K5731611 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$34.90		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$418.80									
21		Lime Rid Non-Foaming Descale or equal; 1 quart bottles	EA	20	\$5.41	NO BID	\$8.95		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$5.86	
		container size			1 Quart		1 Quart								1 Gallon	
		Cost			\$5.41		\$8.95								\$23.43	
					\$108.20											
No Award																
22		Health Gards Toilet Seat Covers or equal, White, 250/Pack, 20 pk/cs	CS	72	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00578		NO BID	\$0.00874	NO BID	\$0.00640		\$0.00673	\$0.00752	
		Case Count					5000			5000		5000		5000	5000	
		Case Cost					\$28.90			\$43.70		\$31.98		\$33.67	\$37.60	
							\$2,080.80									
List A Total Award							\$8,281.50			\$1,815.00	\$645.12	\$1,805.07	\$246.45			
23	LIST B GS NMan	Broom Handle Proline Brush #BRU136 or equal; metal tip; threaded, 60"x15/16" dia, 12/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$3.10	NO BID	\$2.98	\$2.39	NO BID	\$0.39	
		Case Count								12		12	12		12	
		Case Cost								\$37.20		\$35.76	\$28.68		\$4.62	
												\$107.28				

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
31	Swiffer Duster Refill #PGC41767 or equal, 10/bx, 6 bx/cs	CS	36	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.32			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.98		NO BID	\$0.86	
	Case Count					40						60			40	
	Case Cost					\$52.80						\$58.95			\$34.30	
												\$2,122.20				
32	Radiator Brush, Weiler Brush Co #73055 or equal, black horsehair, 24" overall length, 7.5" brush part; 2.5" trim	EA	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.99		NO BID	\$0.14	
	inch											24			18	
	Case Count											1			12	
	Case Cost											\$4.99			\$29.46	
												\$74.85				
33	Scrubbing Pad, Americo Mfg Octopus Pad #541020 or equal, 102 medium duty blue, 4.5"x10", 5/bag, 4 bags/bx	BX	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	\$0.0073	NO BID	\$0.0083		\$0.0064	\$0.0069	\$0.0098
	Box Count									2040		2040		2040	2040	2040
	Box Cost									\$14.80		\$16.99		\$12.99	\$14.17	\$19.99
												\$77.94				
34	Floor Cleaner, Dynamic Research Co Saf-T-Step or equal; slip resistant cleaner treatment for porous, unsealed quarry, ceramic tiles concrete floors, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	3	\$15.82	NO BID	\$74.60			NO BID	\$37.49	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Case Count			3		4				4						
	Case Cost			\$47.46		\$298.40				\$149.95						
						\$895.20										
35	Spray Wipe Cleaner, Hillyard Arsenal Assurance HD #HIL0080125 or equal, 2.5 lt, 4/cs Dispenser will be provided at no cost to item award	CS	24	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$118.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$2,842.80							
36	Stainless Steel Cleaner (Soy base), RMC Natural Shine Stainless Steel Cleaner #REN05005AM or equal, 1 qt, 6/cs	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.00			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$5.63	\$6.40	
	Case Count					6								12	12	
	Case Cost					\$72.00								\$67.50	\$76.84	
						\$432.00										
37	Filmop Single Hooks #60073U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	DZ	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$93.90			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
							\$563.40									
38	Filmop Double Hooks #60080U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	DZ	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$98.62			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$591.72										
39	Filmop Clips #60072U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	DZ	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.60			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$268.80										
40	Floor conditioner neutralizer Hillyard #HIL00831 or equal, 5 oz pouch makes 3 gal, 90 pouches/cntr, 2 cntr/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$0.29	\$0.58	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Case Count								180	400						
	Case Cost								\$51.89	\$230.95						
									\$155.67							
41	Counter brush, Proline Brush #BRU5308 or equal, 13" foam plastic block w/ bi-directional hanging hole, brush face 8", trim 2-5"	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.98			NO BID	\$2.34	NO BID	\$3.99	\$2.49	NO BID	\$4.02	
										\$28.08						
42	Floor burnishing pad; 20" beige, 5/bx	BX	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.40			NO BID	NO BID	\$16.86	\$11.98		\$14.57	\$16.31	
												\$179.70				
43	Bruilin Bru-Clean TBC Disinfectant Tablet, #BRN16105 or equal, 270 tablets/tub, 2 tubs/cs	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$339.10			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$5,086.50										
44	Laundry Detergent Powder Tide HE or equal; must be low sudsing w/ a fresh scent for use in hot or cold water; 143 oz box	BX	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.98			NO BID	\$5.45	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$35.25	
	Case Count					4				12					2	
	Case Cost					\$79.90				\$65.40					\$70.49	
										\$784.80						
45	Liquid Fabric Softener Ultra Downy, April Fresh Scent or equal, 103 oz bottle	EA	9	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.24			NO BID	\$0.33	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.07	
	oz					51				103					64	
	Case Count					1				1					8	
	Case Cost					\$63.08				\$34.00					\$35.59	
										\$306.00						

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
46	Dispatch hospital cleaner disinfectant towels w/ bleach RTU #69101 or equal, 7"x8" size wipe, 50 wipes/bx, 6 bx/cs	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.072			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.733	\$0.06
	Case Count					480									300	450
	Case Cost					\$34.70									\$220.03	\$28.33
															\$1,320.18	
47	Comfresh White Air Freshener dispenser #REN03575CT or equal, 12/cs	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.25			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$2.08	
	Case Count					12									12	
	Case Cost					\$15.00									\$25.00	
															\$225.00	
48	Renown Comfresh Refill #REN03583-CT Mango or equal, 6/cs (must fit item #47 but could be ordered separately)	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$3.74	
	Case Count														12	
	Case Cost														\$44.83	
No Award																
49	Aero Instant free-stand hand sanitizer, MFR #Deb SBS55857 or equal, Non-alcohol; dye-free; fragrance free; 1 liter, 6/cs. Dispensers will be provided as needed (estimate is 36+/- for the contract) at no charge with item award	CS	120	NO BID	NO BID	\$83.10			NO BID	\$49.50	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
															\$5,940.00	
50	Filmop rapido 16" microfiber mops #114-C, RED, launderable, 25/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$136.40			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
															\$1,636.80	
51	Tennant #604838 micro lined environmental filter or equal. For Tennant #3220 upright vacuum, 10/pk, 10 pk/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$77.10	\$9.40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$92.14	
															\$28.20	
52	Floor Scrubbing pad, Premiere #PAD 4017 or equal, 17" blue, 5/bx	BX	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.20			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.80		\$2.36	\$2.97	
	Box Count					5						5		5	5	
	Box Cost					\$10.98						\$8.99		\$11.78	\$14.85	
															\$178.20	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
53	Franklin Furniture Polish #REN05003-AM or equal; 18 oz aerosol cans; 12/cs	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.152			NO BID	\$0.134	NO BID	\$0.139		\$0.147	\$0.198	
	Oz					16.4				18		18		17	18	
	Case Count					12				12		12		12	12	
	Case Cost					\$29.90				\$29.00		\$29.98		\$29.99	\$42.73	
										\$174.00						
54	Utility Brush, Abco #0003 or equal, 8" plastic handle, 3" polypropylene bristles	EA	42	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.47			NO BID	\$2.45	NO BID	\$2.98		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$102.90						
55	Carpet Cleaner, Revitalize Carpet Extraction Cleaner or equal, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	12		NO BID				NO BID			NO BID				
	Diluted Rate Cost				\$0.11	\$0.13				\$0.05	\$0.10			\$0.07	\$0.15	
	Dilution Rate					1:128										
	Oz				128	128				128	128			128	128	
	Case Count				4	4				4	4			4	4	
	Case Cost				\$57.12	\$64.69				\$23.70	\$53.39			\$36.88	\$76.02	
										\$284.40						
56	Crystal Red Stain Plus or equal by Whittaker. Coffee and red stain spotter RTU, 12 oz, 12/cs	CS	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$298.00			NO BID	\$23.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$276.00						
57	Crystal Spotter by Whittaker, trigger spotter RTU no VOCs, 22 fl oz, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$329.00			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$5,922.00										
58	Radiator Brush, straight foam Handle, Black Tampico Fill, Weiler Brush Co #73050 or equal	EA	30	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.55			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$256.50										
59	Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2005 or equal, heavy duty	EA	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.95			NO BID	\$1.60	NO BID	\$1.69		NO BID	\$0.35	
	Case Count											\$30.42			12	
	Case Cost														\$4.18	
60	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 12 lb bucket, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS	72	NO BID	NO BID	\$179.80			\$137.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$139.00	NO BID	
									\$9,907.20							

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
61	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 2.2 lb bag, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS		72	NO BID	NO BID	\$129.90		\$101.16	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$102.30	NO BID	
									\$7,283.52							
62	HOST Spot remover for carpet, 32 oz, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	CS		36	NO BID	NO BID	\$184.08		\$128.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$130.00	NO BID	
									\$4,622.40							
63	Concrobium Mold Control, or equal - Must be a fungistat, mildewstat and de-odorizer. Must effectively eliminates and prevents mold with no bleach, ammonia or VOCs. Must be safe to use on Drywall, wood, composite wood, plastic, concrete, siding, shakes, metal, brick, stone, tile, grout, stucco, fabric, furniture, upholstery, flooring. 1 gal, 4/cs Labels and/or labled 32 oz spray bottles (estimate is 36+/- for the contract) will be supplied at no charge with item award.	CS		12	NO BID	NO BID	\$283.00		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$3,396.00									
64	Scotch-Brite General Purpose Scouring Pad 96 or equal, (Green) 20/cs	CS		18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.21	NO BID	\$0.55	\$0.20	NO BID	\$0.33	
	Case Count									20		20	20		54	
	Case Cost									\$4.25		\$10.99	\$3.99		\$17.72	
												\$197.82				
65	Scotch-Brite Light Cleansing Hand Pad 7445 or equal, 6"x9" (White) 20/cs	CS		12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.39	NO BID	\$1.10	\$0.21	NO BID	\$0.58	
	Case Count									20		20	20		60	
	Case Cost									\$7.70		\$21.99	\$4.29		\$34.52	
												\$263.88				
66	RID® Home Lice or equal, Bed Bug Dust Mite Spray, 5 oz spray can	EA		45	NO BID	\$0.04	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.38	
	Oz					16									20	
	Case Count					12									12	
	Case Cost					\$7.42									\$91.38	
No Award																

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
80		Broom Handle with flex tip, Amsan Renown #REN03927 or equal, self locking corrosion resistant nylon threaded tip not stapled fiberglass finish, 12/cs	CS	24	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.99		NO BID	\$12.00	
		Case Count										12			1	
		Case Cost										\$83.88			\$12.00	
												\$2,013.12				
81		Counter Brush Amsan Renown #REN03956 or equal, flagged plastic bristles, 8" plastic handle, 12/cs	CS	36	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.24		NO BID	\$0.24	NO BID	\$0.19		NO BID	\$5.88	
		Case Count					12			12		12			1	
		Case Cost					\$86.90			\$2.90		\$2.28			\$5.88	
												\$82.08				
82		Scrub Brush Amsan Renown #REN03953 or equal, bi-level with plastic block threaded	EA	120	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.95		NO BID	\$10.95	NO BID	\$8.99		NO BID	\$16.72	
												\$1,078.80				
83		Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid #6482 or equal, natural and synthetic fibers set in square plastic block; iron handle, 6" length; 12/cs	CS	90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.39	\$1.19	NO BID	\$3.75	
		Case Count										12	12		1	
		Case Cost										\$16.68	\$14.28		\$3.75	
													\$1,285.20			
84		Sweep Broom 24", Amsan Renown #REN03947 or equal, features fine, medium heavy sweeps into one floor sweep with plastic block	EA	120	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.40		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.00		NO BID	\$1.31	
		Case Count										8			12	
		Case Cost										\$7.98			\$15.72	
												\$957.60				
85		Clamp Style Handle Gripper, Rubbermaid H236 or equal, holds 5" headband, vinyl coated, aluminum, 60"	EA	36	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.95		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.95		NO BID	\$1.15	
		Case Count					1					1			12	
		Case Cost					\$19.95					\$7.95			\$13.78	
												\$286.20				

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
86		Mop Head, Unisan UNS 1200L or equal, made from recycled PET plastic, absorbs over 4.4 times its weight in water and releases almost 30% upon wringing, longer lasting and lower linting, composed of 30% post-consumer material and 67% post-industrial material and is free from post recycling dyes, 5" headband sewn tail band, must be launderable, 12/cs	CS	72	NO BID	NO BID	\$139.90		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$143.88	\$59.88	NO BID	\$121.20	
													\$4,311.36			
87		Microfiber Pad Dust Mop, Layflat MicroMaster #CB24 or equal; 5"x24", requires no dust mop treatment; heavy duty, must be launderable, 12/cs	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$82.67		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$59.79		NO BID	NO BID	
												\$358.56				
88		Clamp-On Dust Mop Handles, AmSan Renown #REN02621 or equal, 1"x60", holds dust mop frame swivel snap, permanently securely riveted, easily sanitized vinyl-covered wood, 12/cs	CS	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$131.25		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$59.88		NO BID	NO BID	
												\$1,077.84				
89		Clamp-On Dust Mop Frame, AmSan Renown #REN02613 or equal, 24"x5", powder coated black finish	EA	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.99		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.69	\$2.49	NO BID	NO BID	
													\$44.82			
90		Super Polishing Pad, 3M Brand #4100 or equal, white; 20", 5/cs	CS	36	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.39		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.98	\$11.69	NO BID	\$16.31	
													\$420.84			
91		Buffing, Scrubbing or Polishing Pad, 3M Brand #5100 or equal, red, 20", 5/ cs	CS	60	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.28		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.98	\$11.69	NO BID	\$16.31	
													\$420.84			
92		Multipurpose Wipers, AmSan Renown #REN0342 Heavy Duty or equal, 4ply, for glass smooth surface cleaning, 9.75"x6.75", 6/bx, 150 bx/cs	CS	540	NO BID	NO BID	\$52.85		NO BID	\$39.25	NO BID	\$48.98		\$64.40	NO BID	
										\$21,195.00						

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
93		Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 70% polyester/30% Polyamide, can be laundered up to 500 times, lint free, Multiple colors: blue, green, red, yellow, orange, white, purple, black, brown, navy, or pink; 12"x12" Microfiber Cloth 30 grams, 240/cs Samples in all colors must be provided	CS	24	NO BID	NO BID	\$133.900		NO BID	\$93.100	NO BID	\$122.400		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$2,234.40						
94		Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 70% polyester/30% Polyamide, can be laundered up to 500 times, lint free, Multiple colors: blue, green, red, yellow, orange, white, purple, black, brown, navy, or pink, 16"x16" Microfiber Cloths 49 grams, 180/cs Samples in all colors must be provided	CS	24	NO BID	NO BID	\$128.80		NO BID	\$96.000	NO BID	\$106.20		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$2,304.00						
95		Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 70% polyester/30% Polyamide, can be laundered up to 500 times, lint free, Multiple colors: blue, green, red, yellow, orange, white, purple, black, brown, navy, or pink 16"x27" Microfiber Cloth 80 grams, 120/cs Samples in all colors must be provided	CS	24	NO BID	NO BID	\$173.80		NO BID	\$169.200	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$4,060.80						
96		Scrubbing Sponge, light duty, AmSan Renown #REN2117 or equal, white/yellow, 6.1"x3.6"x7", 20/cs	CS	540	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.98		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.99		NO BID	NO BID	
												\$6,474.60				
97		Ultra Fragrance Urinal Screen, AmSan Renown #3062 or equal, freshens urinal for up to 60 days, releases optimized bacteria that cleans the urinal, eliminates odors reduces splash-back, 10/bx, 60 bx/cs	CS	36	NO BID	\$1.51	\$1.48		NO BID	\$1.40	NO BID	\$0.18		\$1.79	\$2.73	
		Case Count				12	60			60		600		72	72	
		Case Cost				\$18.14	\$89.00			\$84.00		\$109.95		\$128.94	\$196.57	
										\$3,024.00						
98-110 were removed from the bid																

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
111		Wypall - All Purpose Wipes, Kimberly-Clark #05701 or equal, 12½"x13", 56/pgk, 18 pgk/cs	CS	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.08		NO BID	\$0.05	NO BID	\$0.09	\$0.07	NO BID	NO BID	
		Case Count					1008			1008		1008	800			
		Case Cost					\$78.50			\$53.04		\$89.95	\$54.98			
										\$954.72						
List C Total Award							\$108,443.28			\$33,772.92		\$18,811.86				
112	List D YCtr	Solar Salt, American Salt or equal, 50 lb bag	EA	450	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.10		NO BID	\$7.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$10.50	
										\$3,150.00						
113		Sparclean Delimer #SPA7655 or equal, pH 1.0-2.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$53.70		NO BID	\$30.00	NO BID	NO BID		\$50.02	NO BID	
										\$60.00						
114		Mr Muscle Oven/Grill Cleaner #JDB91206 or equal, 19 oz aerosol, 6/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.02		NO BID	\$1.90	\$5.25	\$6.33	\$2.50	NO BID	\$5.97	
		Case Count					6			12	6	6	12		6	
		Case Cost					\$54.10			\$22.85	\$31.49	\$37.95	\$29.98		\$35.83	
										\$22.85						
115		Provide, install and maintain top load laundry dispenser system #960100 at no charge for duration of contract for items 116 and 117.	EA	1	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	
116		Clothesline Fresh Colorsafe Bleach 5, SPA #7005-04 or equal, pH 2.5-3.5, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.71		NO BID	\$8.25	NO BID	NO BID		\$8.83	\$13.02	
		UOM					1 Gallon			1 Gallon				1 Gallon	17.5 LB	
		Case Count					4			4				4	4	
		Case Cost					\$50.84			\$33.00				\$35.30	\$52.08	
										\$495.00						
117		Clothesline Fresh Laundry Detergent, SPA #7003 or equal, pH 8.0-9.0, 1 gal, 4/cs, must provide wire rack and top load laundry dispenser system #960100	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$6.75	NO BID	NO BID		\$18.31	\$31.32	
		UOM								1 Gallon				1 Gallon	138 OZ	
		Case Count								4				4	4	
		Case Cost								\$27.00				\$73.25	\$125.28	
										\$405.00						

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
118		Provide, install and maintain front load laundry 3 pump dispenser system #960100 at no charge for duration of contract for Items 119, 120 and 121. "NOTE: All bidders shall include \$0 for this line item"	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00		NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.00	\$0.00	
119		Clothesline Fresh Chlorine Bleach 4, SPA #7005-05 or equal, pH 12.5 - 13.5, 5 gal pail	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.07		NO BID	\$0.0484	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.08	\$0.0498	
		OZ					5 Gal			5 Gal				5 Gal	121 oz	
		Case Count					1			1				1	3	
		Case Cost					\$43.90			\$31.00				\$51.56	\$18.06	
										\$62.00						
120		Clothesline Fresh BLD Detergent, SPA #7002 or equal, pH 13.5-14.0, 5 gal pail	EA	7	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.148		NO BID	\$0.13	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.146		
		oz					5 Gal			5 Gal				5 Gal	40 lb	
		Cost					\$94.80			\$81.00				\$93.25	\$31.54	
										\$567.00						
121		Clothesline Fresh Sour/Softener, SPA #7009 or equal, pH2.8-3.5, 5 gal pail	EA	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.115		NO BID	\$0.089	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.121	\$0.076	
		Oz					5 Gal			5 Gal				5 Gal	2 Gal	
		Case Count					1			1				1	2	
		Case Cost					\$73.80			\$56.70				\$77.47	\$38.91	
										\$283.50						
122		Provide, install and maintain dispenser system at no charge for duration of contract for Items 123 and 124. "NOTE: All bidders shall include \$0 for this line item"	EA	1	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	
123		Sparclean Warewash Hi Temp Rinse Aid, SPA #7652 or equal, 52 pH 1.0-2.0; 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	20	NO BID	NO BID	\$106.80		NO BID	\$76.70	NO BID	NO BID		\$88.40	\$683.92	
										\$1,534.00						
124		All Temp Detergent, SPA #7650 or equal, pH 13.5-14.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$51.50	NO BID	NO BID		\$84.26	\$24.69	
										\$772.50						
125		Saniwipe Surface Sanitizing Wiper, #NPPQ94384 or equal, 100 wipes/cntr, 6 cntr/cs	CS	54	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.43		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.08		\$0.07	\$0.15	
		Case Count					100					600		750	100	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
	Case Cost						\$42.99					\$47.98		\$55.75	\$15.24	
No Award																
126	Penetrol Dish Soap for Restaurant, #REN02765-MS or equal, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.90			NO BID	\$25.95	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$53.53	
										\$129.75						
127	Sparclean Pot N Pan Detergent SPA #7656 or equal, pH 7.5 - 8.8, 1 gal, 4/cs Must provide, install and maintain dispensing system for product at no charge for duration of contract	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$69.70			NO BID	\$32.50	NO BID	NO BID		\$66.18	NO BID	
										\$32.50						
128	Consume Eco-Lyzer Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner, SPA #3297 or equal, EPA Reg. No. 5741-24, pH 6.0 - 7.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	7	NO BID	NO BID	\$68.75			NO BID	\$28.95	NO BID	NO BID		\$59.90	\$132.00	
										\$202.65						
129	Lite'n Foamy Cranberry Ice, SPA #3152 or equal, bio-based foaming hand, hair body wash, pH 6.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$94.80			NO BID	\$35.00	NO BID	NO BID		\$63.98	NO BID	
														\$639.80		
130	Shineline Multi Surface Cleaner, SPA #0040-04 or equal, high performance, high Dilution detergent, mint fragrance, once a month utilization, pH10.8 - 11.2, 2.5 oz/gal Dilution rate, 2 lt, 4/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID				NO BID		NO BID	NO BID				
	Dilution Rate Cost					\$0.31				\$0.20				\$0.34	\$0.26	
	Dilution Rate					2.5:128				2.5:128				2.5:128	2.5:128	
	oz (67.628 oz/2 ltr)					67.63				67.63				67.63	128	
	Case Count					4				4				4	4	
	Case Cost					\$39.90				\$25.00				\$43.00	\$132.00	
						\$79.80										
131	Shineline Emulsifier Plus, SPA #0084-05 or equal, High performance speed stripper, pH 13.5-13.7, 5 gal pail	CS	1	\$81.90	NO BID	\$79.70			NO BID	\$48.00	NO BID	NO BID		\$77.88	\$58.02	
										\$48.00						
132	Elements Synthetic Floor Protectant,# E13-14MN or equal, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$158.31	
No Award																

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
133	Elements Gloss Restorer, #E14-14MN or equal, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$122.24	
No Award																
134	Elements Scrub Recoat Cleaner, #E18-14MN or equal, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
No Award																
135	MPC Maintenance Solutions Rejuvenator, #REJ-14MN or equal, Grout restorer-stain remover, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.14			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.19	
	Oz					128									32	
	Case Count					4									12	
	Case Cost					\$73.40									\$74.44	
No Award																
136	Spartan Shinline Seal, SPA #4004 or equal, 24% solids, thermoplastic sealer/finish, compatible with ultra high-speed floor coatings, conditions, seals and protects, pH8.3, 1 gal, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$79.90			NO BID	\$53.56	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$124.52	
										\$53.56						
137	Spartan iShine, SPA #4055 or equal, 25% high solids, durable in low maintenance program and high speed applications, pH 8.0-9.0; 5 gal pail	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.90			NO BID	\$58.55	NO BID	NO BID		\$90.95	NO BID	
										\$117.10						
138	Provide, install and maintain dispensing system at no charge for duration of contract for Items 139 and 140.	EA	1	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	
139	Glass Cleaner Spartan Bio-Renewables, SPA #4835 or equal; Green Seal Certified, must be able to be used on glass, plastic, and Plexiglas; PH range of 7.5-8.5, concentrated 1:64 Dilution rate, minimum 81% bio based content as certified by an independent USDA authorized laboratory; 2 lt, 4/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID				NO BID		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		
	Dilution Rate Cost					\$0.5445				\$0.76					1:64	
	Dilution Rate					1:64				1:64					1:64	
	oz (67.628 oz/2 ltr)					68				67.63					128	
	Case Count					4				4					4	
	Case Cost					\$69.70				\$97.06					\$132.00	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
155	Hillyard Host Dry Extraction Sponges (for Host Liberator Extractor Vac) #HSTC12034 or equal, 12 lb bucket, 4/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$137.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$275.20							
156	Hillyard Host spot remover (for Host Liberator Extractor Vac) #HSTS12L or equal, quart, 12/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$128.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$256.80							
157	Hillyard Non-Acid restroom disinfectant (for C3 HP Cleaning Companion), #HIL0070322, ½ gal, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTE)	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$74.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$148.64							
158	Hillyard Green select bathroom cleaner (for C3 HP Cleaning Companion), #HIL0070822, ½ gal, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTE)	CS	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$92.51	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$555.06							
159	Brush dual surface with squeegee 10" blade, #CSM3619014 or equal	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$11.73	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$23.46							
160	Mop MF pocket premium fit trowel 11" green, Hillyard #HIL20057 or equal, 12/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$78.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$78.40							
161	Mop MF pocket premium fit trowel 11" red, Hillyard #HIL20056 or equal, 12/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$78.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$78.40							
162	Cloth MF GP 250 GM 12"x12", red, 12 pk, Hillyard #HIL20029 or equal	PK	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.95			\$80.64	\$93.10	NO BID	\$7.08		NO BID	NO BID	
						\$12.95										
163	Cloth MF GP 250 GM 16"x16", green, 12 pk, Hillyard #HIL20026 or equal	PK	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.90			\$90.40	\$96.00	NO BID	\$7.08		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$90.40							

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
164	Mop Dust Infinity twist cotton 5"x60" blue, #HIL53409 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.90			\$22.24	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.98	\$12.98	NO BID	\$1.32	
	Case Count					2			2			2	2		12	
	Case Cost					\$49.80			\$44.48			\$41.96	\$25.96		\$15.88	
												\$83.92				
165	Handle Dust Mop Quick change 60" Wood (mop Stick), Hillyard #HIL22608 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.45			\$9.11	\$1.23	NO BID	\$6.99	\$4.99	NO BID	\$1.90	
	Case Count					2			2	2		2	2		6	
	Case Cost					\$34.90			\$18.22	\$2.45		\$13.98	\$9.98		\$11.38	
												\$27.96				
166	Frame Dust Mop quick change 5"x60", Hillyard #HIL52821, or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.99			\$10.29	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.98	\$11.98	NO BID	NO BID	
									\$20.58							
167	Cart Cleaning MF 2 Tier metal with buckets, includes 2 large and small buckets, 1 laundry bag, Hillyard #HIL20016 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$540.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$1,080.00							
168	Bucket PT MF with handle 1.5 gallon yellow, (measuring solution) Hillyard #HIL20015 or equal	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$9.28	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$9.28							
169	Bucket PT MF with Lid and Handle 6 gal Blue, Hillyard #HIL20011 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$47.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$95.20							
170	Bucket PT MF with Lid and Handle 6 gal Gray, Hillyard #HIL20012 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$44.28	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$88.46							
171	Bucket PT MF with Lid and Handle 3.5 gal Blue, Hillyard #HIL20013 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$28.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$56.00							
172	Bucket PT MF with Lid and Handle 3.5 gal Gray, #HIL20014 or equal, 2/cs	CS	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$30.12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
									\$60.24							

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies															
Spec #45-10/17															
Purchasing															
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services No Samples Sent
															Venus Supplies & Services Alt
173	Duster Flexible HD Loop MF Black with 12" Handle, Hillyard #HIL20038 or equal, 2/cs	CS		2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$31.42 \$62.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
174	Duster Blue Replacement Head for Flexible Duster, Hillyard #HIL20039 or equal, 12/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$102.00 \$102.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
175	Frame 16"x5" for Roller Wringer, #CRPTABFRAME or equal, 1/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$27.90 \$7.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
176	Mop MF Pocket Premium 18" Black Mesh Back, Hillyard #HIL20049 or equal, 24/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$206.66 \$206.66	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
177	Handle Tel Aluminum 39"x5"x72" Black with Blue Grip, Hillyard #HIL20042 or equal	EA		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$10.60 \$10.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
178	Mop Loop MF with Tabs 18" (assorted colors) #CRPWAVETABB18 or equal, 12/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$118.32 \$118.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
179	Nutra-Rinse, Hillyard #HIL0021094 or equal, 1 qt, 2/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
No Award															
180	Pad Wet Room High Absorbency 18" Blue, Rubbermaid #RUBQ416BL or equal, 6/cs	CS		4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
No Award															
181	Upright Vacuum Progen 15, #PTM107330 or equal, 3/cs	CS		1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$1,145.37	\$415.97 \$415.97	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
182	Vacuum bags for Progen 15, #PTM107330 or equal, 24/cs	CS		2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$266.66	\$10.42 \$20.84	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
183	Consume liquid natural way, 5 gal pail, SupplyWorks #SPA3102-05 or equal	EA		1	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.90		NO BID	\$33.81	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services No Samples Sent	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
							\$89.90									
184		Auto drain dispenser for Consume liquid natural way, SupplyWorks #SPA920500 or equal Award 183, 184 & 185 together	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$189.90		NO BID	\$413.18	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$189.90									
185		Squeeze Tubes for Auto Drain Dispenser, SupplyWorks #SPA960500 or equal	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$150.26		NO BID	\$8.88	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$150.26									
186		Hoover handle assembly, #H00440002393 or equal, upright vac #CH50102 or #CH50100, 3/cs	CS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$54.86	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$54.86						
187		Hoover roller brush, #H00440001916 or equal, upright vacuum #CH50102 or #CH50100	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.10		NO BID	\$24.31	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$24.31						
188		Hoover alergen bag, #H00AH10170 or equal, upright vacuum #CH50102 or #CH50100, 10 bags/pk	PK	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$379.50		NO BID	\$33.26	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$99.78						
189		Windsor Sensor vacuum bag, #MM5300 or equal, 10 bags/pk	PK	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$139.40		NO BID	\$13.68	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$41.04						
190		Rational Care-Tab or equal, 100/tub	TUB	7	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
191		Rational Reiniger-Tab or equal, detergent tab, 100/tub	TUB	7	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
List D Total Award						\$1,221.32	\$1,446.52		\$3,424.44	\$8,701.41		\$177.78	\$639.80			
192	List E Parks	"Freshmatic" Neutra air or citrus refill or equal, 6.17 oz, 12/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$69.48		NO BID	NO BID	
												\$208.44				

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
193		Gojo Derma Pro #GJ9112 lotion or equal, 800 ml, 12/cs	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$54.90		NO BID	\$32.20	NO BID	\$49.98		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$96.60						
194		Misco Products Pearl Drop Lotion Hand Soap or equal, 1 gal Bottle, 4/cs Must provide, install and maintain dispensing system for product at no charge for duration of contract	CS	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$72.00	\$79.70	NO BID	\$26.87	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$134.35						
195		Gojo Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer Bag-in-Box or equal, 800-ml Refill for wall dispenser, 6/cs Must provide, install and maintain dispensing system for product at no charge for duration of contract	CS	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$59.49	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
										\$178.47						
List E Total Award										\$409.42	\$208.44					
196	List F	Lobby Dust Pan Broom, Rubbermaid #6374 or equal, 27" handle	EA	51	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$2.84	NO BID	\$3.98	\$3.69	NO BID	\$3.40	
				4												
Gen Serv				13												
GS Nman				34												
DOC																
197		Lobby Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2531 or equal	EA	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$7.44	NO BID	\$6.89		NO BID	\$10.54	
												\$413.40				
Gen Serv				5												
GS Nman				15												
DOC				40												
												\$275.60				
198		Scrubbing Sponge, Premiere Pads #PAD 174 or equal, yellow/green, 3.6x6.1x0.7, 20/cs	CS	48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.704	NO BID	\$0.799	\$0.699	NO BID	\$0.679	
Case Count															40	
Case Cost															\$27.15	
												\$767.04				
Gen Serv				10												
GS Nman				9												
DOC				29												
												\$159.80				
												\$143.82				
												\$463.42				
199		Wax Bag for Sanitary Napkin Disposal, Hospeco or equal, 5"x8", 500/cs	CS	360	NO BID	\$0.0257	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.0252	\$0.0304	\$0.0270		\$0.0359	\$0.0880	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
		Case Count				1000				500	500	500		500	250	
		Case Cost				\$25.73				\$12.59	\$15.21	\$13.49		\$17.95	\$21.99	
										\$4,532.40						
	Gen Serv			1						\$12.59						
	GS Nman			1						\$12.59						
	DOC			351						\$4,419.09						
	YCtr			7						\$88.13						
200		Stripper, Brulin Terragreen Stripper #BRN361002-07 or equal, 2.5 gal, 2/cs size	CS	12	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.98		NO BID	\$9.84	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Gen Serv	Case Count					5 gal			2.5 gal						
	DOC	Case Cost					1			2						
		Case Cost					\$64.90			\$49.18						
No Award																
201		Bowl Cleaner, Rochester Midland Bowl Tamer #118112 or equal, cleaning, descaling, derusting and polishing toilets, Must be thickened liquid, 2 oz; 12/cs	CS	105	NO BID	NO BID	\$59.20		NO BID	\$14.75	NO BID	NO BID		\$21.99	NO BID	
	Gen Serv	No award		29						\$1,548.75						
	GS NMan	No award		10												
	DOC			66						\$973.50						
202		Wet Mop Handle, Rubbermaid Gripper #H235 or equal, aluminum, 54" long; for 5 headband mops to hold Hillyard #24327 or equal type, 12/cs	CS	33	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.88		NO BID	NO BID	
	Gen Serv			9								\$2,966.04				
	DOC			24								\$808.92				
												\$2,157.12				
203		Cube Truck, Rubbermaid #4619 or equal, metal frame, 600 lb 20 cu ft cap, 48"x34"x36"	EA	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$679.95		NO BID	NO BID	
	Gen Serv			3								\$4,079.70				
	GS Nman			3								\$2,039.85				
												\$2,039.85				
204		Toilet Bowl Brush, Rubbermaid #6310 or equal, plastic handle, polypropylene fill, 14.5" long, color: white, 24/cs	CS	304	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$0.04	\$0.68	\$1.29		NO BID	\$2.42	
		Case Count								24	24	24			1	
		Case Cost								\$0.98	\$16.32	\$30.96			\$2.42	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
																No Samples Sent
										\$297.92						
Gen Serv				10						\$9.80						
GS Nman				20						\$19.60						
DOC				268						\$262.64						
YCtr				6						\$5.88						
205		Stainless Steel Cleaner Polish, 3M #14002 or equal, 21 oz can, 12/cs	CS	9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	\$39.03	NO BID	\$121.95	\$32.75	NO BID	NO BID	
												\$1,097.55				
Gen Serv				2								\$243.90				
GS Nman				6								\$731.70				
YCtr				1								\$121.95				
206		Floor stripping pad, 3M #7200 or equal, Open Weave Design, 20" color: black, 5/bx	CS	36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	\$27.63	\$29.98	\$11.98	NO BID	\$16.31	
													\$431.28			
Gen Serv				3									\$35.94			
DOC				33									\$395.34			
207		Terragreen HyperMaxx Green Seal Certified 2x-Maxx Concentrate hydrogen peroxide #191007-RD, all facility cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) To be used w/ Item 69 Dispensing System	CS	63	NO BID	NO BID	\$157.37		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$9,914.31									
Gen Serv				33			\$5,193.21									
GS Nman				30			\$4,721.10									
208		Brulin Maxima #3 Unique, soft acidic non-alkaline disinfectant 6-in-1 cleaner with broad range germicidal activity, HBV effective Item #19003-33, 64 oz btl, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) To be used w/ Item 69 Dispensing System	CS	144	NO BID	NO BID	\$99.70		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$14,356.80									
Gen Serv				24			\$2,392.80									
GS Nman				120			\$11,964.00									
209		Peroxi II by Spartan RTU Antibacterial Cleaning Power or equal, kills 99.9% of household bacteria (*Staphylo-coccus aureus and Enterbacter aergenes) in 2 minutes, 32 oz, 12/cs	CS	90	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.12		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.09	\$0.26	
		Oz					32							32	128	

3-year Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies																
Spec #45-10/17																
Purchasing																
			Unit	Qty	Apter Industries	Bob Barker	General Chemical Supply	General Chemical Supply Alt	Hillyard Delaware Valley	PA Paper Supply	Penn Jersey Paper	Pyramid School Products	Pyramid School Products Alt	Spruce Industries	Venus Supplies & Services	Venus Supplies & Services Alt
															No Samples Sent	
		Case Count					12							12	4	
		Case Cost					\$46.22							\$35.90	\$132.00	
														\$3,231.00		
Gen Serv				54										\$1,938.60		
GS Nman				36										\$1,292.40		
210		Bleach, Clorox or Equal, 96 oz, 6/cs	CS	63	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.53		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$726.39									
Gen Serv				51			\$588.03									
GS Nman				12			\$138.36									
211		Dermarite Total Foam, 1000 ml #0026F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided as needed, at no charge with item award.	CS	406	NO BID	NO BID	\$98.40		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$39,950.40									
Gen Serv				154			\$15,153.60									
GS Nman				252			\$24,796.80									
212		Dermarite Kleen Foam anti-bacterial 1000 ml, Item #0093F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided at no charge with item award	CS	384	NO BID	NO BID	\$108.40		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
							\$41,625.60									
Gen Serv				21			\$2,276.40									
GS Nman				363			\$39,349.20									
213		Plastic Spray Bottle; 32 oz translucent with graduations	EA	150	NO BID	\$0.75	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.49		NO BID	\$1.75	
		Case Count				3						1			1	
		Case Cost				\$2.25						\$0.49			\$1.75	
GS Nman				96								\$73.50				
DOC				50								\$47.04				
YCtr				4								\$24.50				
												\$1.96				
214		Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz spray bottle; adjustable polyethylene spray trigger w/ nylon filter; chemical resistant heavy duty w/ viton seal (must fit item #213 but could be ordered separately)	EA	150	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.49		NO BID	\$1.75	
												\$73.50				
GS Nman				96								\$47.04				
DOC				50								\$24.50				
YCtr				4								\$1.96				

