

18-MONTH CONTRACT TO PROVIDE SNOW REMOVAL SERVICES										
Purchasing										
Spec #49-10/16										
		Cooper Remodeling	DMC Commercial Snow Management	Four Seasons Construction Group	Greenscape Landscape	Cutting Edge Total Lawn Care	M & M Lawncare East	Phillips Contracting	Wright Brothers Snowplowing	Wright Brothers Snowplowing 3% Discount Applied
	(2" or more but less than 5")									
<b>GROUP 1</b>										
	<b>FORENSIC FACILITY</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	\$280.00	No Bid	\$265.00	\$300.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	<b>EMERGENCY SERVICES BUILDING</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	\$750.00	No Bid	\$425.00	\$500.00	No Bid	No Bid	
<b>GROUP 2</b>										
	<u>D.C. 07-1-01</u> <b>GALLAGHER</b>	\$350.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	\$350.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
	<u>D.C. 07-1-07</u> <b>BARANOSKI</b>	\$300.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$250.00	No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
	<u>D.C. 07-1-08</u> <b>KELLY</b>	\$300.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$250.00	No Bid	\$350.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
	<u>D.C. 07-1-03</u> <b>KLINE</b>	\$300.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$250.00	No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
<b>GROUP 3</b>										
	<u>D.C. 07-1-11</u> <b>BURNS</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	No Bid	\$500.00	No Bid	\$350.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
	<u>D.C. 07-1-10</u> <b>VISLOSKY</b>	\$480.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$500.00	No Bid	\$400.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
	<u>D.C. 07-1-04</u> <b>WAGNER</b>	\$325.00	\$875.00	No Bid	\$250.00	No Bid	\$350.00	No Bid	\$249.00	241.53
<b>GROUP 4</b>										
	<u>D.C. 07-1-09</u> <b>FINELLO</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	\$230.00	No Bid	\$245.00	\$350.00	\$450.00	No Bid	
	<u>D.C. 07-2-02</u> <b>DOUPLE</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	\$230.00	No Bid	\$245.00	\$400.00	\$450.00	No Bid	
<b>GROUP 5</b>										
	<u>D.C. 07-3-01</u> <b>SNOW</b>	No Bid	\$875.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	<u>D.C. 07-3-03</u> <b>GAMBARDELLA</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	<u>D.C. 07-2-05</u> <b>ROTH</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$260.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	