

Purchase of Dental Chair and Equipment.2; Spec #55-12/21						
No.	Description	Type	Quantity	Henry Schein Inc	Benco Dental Supply Co.	Jefferson Medical & Imaging Inc
1	DCI Edge, DCI Edge, Series 5 Dental Chair with 200 Watt Transformer, Black Satin Product #C5550, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$4,956.00	\$5,142.50	\$7,875.00
2	DCI Edge Swing Mount with Auto Dental Unit & Light Pole, Gray, Product #DS5550, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$4,134.00	\$4,290.00	\$5,720.00
3	DCI ISO-C 6-Pin Power Optic HP Tubing, 7', Gray, Product #8904E, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$134.00	\$130.62	\$173.95
4	DCI Deluxe Single Handpiece Light Source System with Transformer, Product #8313E, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$92.00	\$89.38	\$119.00
5	DCI System Series 5 Swing Mounted Light, 115V, Gray, Product # LS5550, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$1,975.00	\$2,048.75	\$2,732.50
6	DCI Rear Cuspidor with Bowl Mounted Syringe, HVE & SE, Product #RM5651, NO SUBSTITUTE	Base	1	\$1,789.00	\$1,856.25	\$2,475.00
7	DCI Edge Series 5 Doctor's Stool; Product #SD5051, NO SUBSTITUTE, Black Satin	Base	1	\$484.00	No Bid	\$125.00
8	Midmark Classic Series Wet-Ring Vacuum, Model CV3R, HP: 1, Maximum Users: 3, Water Recycling: Yes	Base	1	\$2,361.00	\$2,498.18	\$3,310.00
8.1	Alternate or Equal Midmark Classic Series Wet-Ring Vacuum, Model CV3R, HP: 1, Maximum Users: 3, Water Recycling: Yes	Option	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Midmark Oil-Less Air Compressor, Model P22, Voltage: 230, User Capacity: 1-3	Base	1	\$4,387.00	\$4,641.30	\$6,110.00
9.1	Alternate or Equal Midmark Oil-Less Air Compressor, Model P22, Voltage: 230, User Capacity: 1-3	Option	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Midmark Water Filter/By-Pass System-Water Filter/By-Pass System, Solenoid and Low Voltage Contactor; Pipe size: .75	Base	1	\$928.00	\$981.45	\$1,300.00
10.1	Alternate or Equal Midmark Water Filter/By-Pass System-Water Filter/By-Pass System, Solenoid and Low Voltage Contactor; Pipe size: .75	Option	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Midmark Master Control Panel- Air/Vac/H2O, Part #77001590	Base	1	\$267.00	\$282.15	\$317.10
11.1	Alternate or Equal Midmark Master Control Panel- Air/Vac/H2O, Part #77001590	Option	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Solmetex NXT Hg5 mini Amalgam Separator, Product # NXT-HG5-Mini	Base	1	\$597.00	\$682.50	\$1,031.90
12.1	Alternate or Equal Solmetex NXT Hg5 mini Amalgam Separator, Product # NXT-HG5-Mini	Option	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total Extended				\$22,104.00	\$22,643.08	\$31,289.45
Advertised in Newspaper						
Posted on PennBid						
22 Planholders						
3 Responses						
Apparent Low Bidder						
Recommended for Award						