

24	Hospeco Health Guards Toilet Seat Covers, #HOS HG-500, White, 250/Pack, 20 pk/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	240,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.03	\$ 1.56	No Bid	\$ 0.02
24.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	240,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.01	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 87.00	No Bid
25	Spray bottle, Unisan #UNS 32, mix dispense concentrated cleaning products, natural color, plastic bottles have quantity graduations, 32 oz capacity (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	364	No Bid	\$ 1.00	No Bid	\$ 1.31	\$ 0.49	No Bid	\$ 4.87
25.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	364	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.69	No Bid
26	Trigger Sprayer, Unisan #UNS 922-9, 9.5", for 32 oz spray btl (must fit item #25 but could be ordered separately) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	1,264.00	No Bid	\$ 1.03	No Bid	\$ 1.65	\$ 0.54	No Bid	\$ 1.27
26.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (must fit item #25.1 but could be ordered separately) (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	1,264.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.74	No Bid
27	Simoniz Almond Pearl Liquid Hand Soap, #CS0215004, 1 gal Btl, 4/cs (Enter cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.89	\$ 8.49	No Bid	\$ 15.39
27.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.21	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.60	No Bid
28	Carpet Cleaner, Revitalize Carpet Extraction Cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.43	\$ 10.22	No Bid	\$ 60.50
28.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.99	No Bid
29	Dual Surface Scrub Brush, Proline #BRU3410, 10" plastic block with threaded handle hole (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	128	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.82	\$ 7.00	No Bid	\$ 23.14
29.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	128	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.82	No Bid
30	Grout brush, Proline #BRU9008, 8" long, plastic handle (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.19	\$ 0.58	No Bid	\$ 3.96
30.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	36	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.49	No Bid
31	Swiffer Duster w/ extended handle #PGC44750, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	168	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.85	\$ 8.78	\$ 15.40	\$ 2.47
31.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	168	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Swiffer Duster Refill #PGC41767, 10/bx, 6 bx/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	32,460.00	No Bid	\$ 8.28	No Bid	\$ 15.68	\$ 8.66	\$ 22.90	\$ 1.13
32.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	32,460.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
33	Radiator Brush, Weiler Brush Co #73055, black horsehair, 24" overall length, 7.5" brush part; 2.5" trim (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.40
33.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34	Scrubbing Pad, Americo Mfg Octopus Pad #541020, 102 medium duty blue, 4.5"x10", 5/bag, 4 bags/bx (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	8,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.61	\$ 10.34	No Bid	\$ 2.20
34.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	8,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.58	No Bid
35	Floor Cleaner, Dynamic Research Co Saf-T-Step; slip resistant cleaner treatment for porous, unsealed quarry, ceramic tiles concrete floors, 1 gal, 4/cs (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.90
35.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	Spray Wipe Cleaner, Hillyard Arsenal Assurance HD #HIL0080125, 2.5 lt, 4/cs Dispenser will be provided at no cost to item award (Enter the cost for one liter)	Base	lt	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.33
36.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one liter)	Option	lt	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	Stainless Steel Cleaner (Soy base), RMC Natural Shine Stainless Steel Cleaner #REN05005AM, 1 qt, 6/cs (Enter the cost for one quart)	Base	qt	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.47	\$ 4.11	No Bid	\$ 21.87
37.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one quart)	Option	qt	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	Filmop rapido 16" microfiber mops #6090114FF, GREEN, launderable, 25/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 285.00	\$ 163.00	\$ 11.50
39	RED, launderable, 25/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 285.00	\$ 163.00	\$ 11.50
40	Filmop Velcro Strip #P191038E (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.46
41	Filmop Velcro Strip #P191039E (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.15
42	Telescoping Handle #0000AM3040A, for Filmop Folding Mop Holder, 38"-72", 10/cs (must fit item #41 but could be ordered separately) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.85
43	32" Dust Mop Holder w/ replaceable Velcro straps, Filmop #5278, 10/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.37
43.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
44	Floor conditioner neutralizer Hillyard #HIL00831, 5 oz pouch makes 3 gal, 90 pouches/cntr, 2 cntr/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 47.49
44.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	Counter brush, Proline Brush #BRU5308, 13" foam plastic block w/ bi-directional hanging hole, brush face 8", trim 2-5" (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	152	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.98	\$ 3.25	No Bid	\$ 12.05
45.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	152	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
46	Floor burnishing pad; 20" beige, 5/bx (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	10	No Bid	\$ 5.51	\$ 3.70	\$ 6.17	\$ 2.92	No Bid	\$ 17.59

	Bru-Clean Tbc 2 Effervescent Disinfectant Tablet. Must be US EPA Registered Cleaner-Disinfectant with efficacy against bacteria in biofilms, C. difficile spores, Mycobacterium bovis (TB), and other microorganisms in 4 minutes. Item #101054; 256 tablets/tub, 2tubs/case	Base	ea	11,340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.30	No Bid	\$ 0.96	\$ 0.47
47	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	11,340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48	Laundry Detergent Powder Tide HE; must be low sudsing w/ a fresh scent for use in hot or cold water; 143 oz box (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	1,716.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.33	\$ 0.22	No Bid	\$ 0.15
48.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	1,716.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.48	No Bid
49	Liquid Fabric Softener Ultra Downy, April Fresh Scent , 103 oz bottle (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	103	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.30	\$ 0.15	No Bid	\$ 22.17
49.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	103	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50	Dispatch hospital cleaner disinfectant towels w/ bleach RTU #69101, 7"x8" size wipe, 50 wipes/bx, 6 bx/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.21	\$ 16.67	No Bid	\$ 17.32
50.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
51	Comfresh White Air Freshener dispenser #REN0357SCT, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.71	\$ 4.36	No Bid	\$ 15.32
51.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	Renown Comfresh Refill #REN03583-CT Mango, 6/cs (must fit item #51 but could be ordered separately) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.38	\$ 9.07	No Bid	\$ 23.87
52.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (must fit item #51.1 but could be ordered separately) (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
53	Deb InstantFOAM Complete hand sanitizer, Instant Foam #IFCLU, Alcohol-based foam hand sanitizer topical solution. Must be perfume and dye-free alcohol-based InstantFOAM hand sanitizer with moisturizer and skin conditioner. Glove compatible. 1 liter refills, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter cost for one case)	Base	cs	30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 125.16	No Bid	\$ 86.46	No Bid	\$ 17.55
54	Purel advanced hand sanitizer, 1 liter bag, 4/cs #2156-08 (Enter the cost for one liter)	Base	lt	96	No Bid	\$ 9.65	\$ 14.78	\$ 0.02	\$ 12.37	\$ 15.95	\$ 15.05
54.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (PRODUCT MUST FIT IN EXISTING DISPENSER-PURRELL NXT PUSH DISPENSER #GOJ212006) (Enter the cost for one liter)	Option	lt	96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
55	Floor Scrubbing pad, Premiere #PAD 4017 , 17" blue, 5/bx (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	1,135.00	No Bid	\$ 3.98	\$ 2.85	\$ 13.45	\$ 2.40	No Bid	\$ 3.56
55.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	1,135.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.99	No Bid
56	Champion Sprayon Furniture Polish, Lemon, 17oz, Aerosol, 12cans/cs Item#CHP5136 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.10	No Bid	\$ 35.90	\$ 4.86
57	Utility Brush, Abco #0003, 8" plastic handle, 3" polypropylene bristles (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.07	\$ 4.40	No Bid	\$ 1.64
57.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
58	Carpet Cleaner, Revitalize Carpet Extraction Cleaner , 1 gal, 4/cs (Enter the cost for one gal)	Base	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.43	\$ 10.22	No Bid	\$ 60.50
58.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gal)	Option	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
59	Crystal Red Stain Plus by Whittaker. Coffee and red stain spotter RTU, 12 oz, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.08
59.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60	Crystal Spotter by Whittaker, trigger spotter RTU no VOCs, 22 fl oz, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for case)	Base	cs	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.73
61	Radiator Brush, straight foam Handle, Black Tampico Fill, Weiler Brush Co #73050 (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.55
61.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
62	Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2005 , heavy duty (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	128	No Bid	\$ 3.31	No Bid	\$ 8.16	\$ 2.18	\$ 4.98	\$ 17.27
62.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	128	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
63	Lobby Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2531 (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	40	No Bid	\$ 15.63	No Bid	\$ 35.74	\$ 9.96	No Bid	\$ 38.27
63.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.98	No Bid
64	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 12 lb bucket, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.66
65	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 2.2 lb bag, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.62
66	HOST Spot remover for carpet, 32 oz, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.05
67	Condroxium mold control, item #025071 - must be a fungistat, mildewstat and de-odorizer. Must effectively eliminate and prevent mold with no bleach, ammonia or VOCs. Must be safe to use on Drywall, wood, composite wood, plastic, concrete, siding, shakes, metal, brick, stone, tile, grout, stucco, fabric, furniture, upholstery, and flooring. 1 gal, 4/cs Labels and/or labeled 32 oz spray bottles will be supplied at no charge with item award (estimate is 36+/- for the contract) (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.50	No Bid	\$ 43.73
67.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68	Scotch-Brite General Purpose Scouring Pad 96 , (Green) 20/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.46	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.46

138	Stripper, Brulin Terragreen Stripper #BRN361002 07, 2.5 gal, 2/cs (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 128.00	\$ 118.24
138.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
139	Bowl Cleaner, Rochester Midland Bowl Tamer #118112, cleaning, descaling, derusting and polishing toilets, Must be thickened liquid, 2 oz; 12/cs (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	oz	3,264.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.90	\$ 0.21	No Bid	\$ 5.30
139.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	oz	3,264.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.12	No Bid
140	Cube Truck, Rubbermaid #4619, metal frame, 600 lb 20 cu ft cap, 48"x34"x36" (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,208.12	\$ 759.23	\$ 757.82	\$ 890.00	\$ 640.94
140.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
141	Stainless Steel Cleaner Polish, 3M #14002, 21 oz can, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	1,764.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.76	No Bid	\$ 1.09	\$ 12.66
141.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	1,764.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
142	Floor stripping pad, 3M #7200, Open Weave Design, 20" color: black, 5/bx (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	50	No Bid	\$ 5.60	No Bid	\$ 13.24	\$ 3.96	No Bid	\$ 7.85
142.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.71	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.69	No Bid
143	Peroxil II by Spartan RTU Antibacterial Cleaning Power, kills 99.9% of household bacteria (*Staphylococcus aureus and Enterobacter aerogenes) in 2 minutes, 32 oz, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	58,368.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.12	\$ 0.10	No Bid	\$ 4.62
143.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	58,368.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
144	Bleach, Clorox, 96 oz, 6/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	24,768.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.12	\$ 0.03	\$ 0.08	No Bid
144.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	24,768.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.03	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.08	\$ 4.17
145	Derma-rite Total Foam, 1000 ml #0026F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided as needed, at no charge with item award. (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	473	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.29	No Bid	\$ 99.40	\$ 10.34
146	Derma-rite Kleen Foam anti-bacterial 1000 ml, Item #0093F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided at no charge with item award (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	256	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.46	\$ 107.10	No Bid
147	Plastic Spray Bottle; 32 oz translucent with graduations (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	172	No Bid	\$ 1.00	\$ 0.96	\$ 1.27	\$ 0.49	\$ 0.69	\$ 0.97
148	Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz spray bottle; adjustable polyethylene spray trigger w/ nylon filter; chemical resistant heavy duty w/ viton seal (must fit item #147 but could be ordered separately) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	172	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.96	No Bid	\$ 0.54	\$ 6.95	No Bid
149	Crystal Odor Protein by Whittaker, Stain Odor Remover, effective on organic stains, RTU no VOC's, 12 oz, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	1,296.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.71	\$ 9.99
149.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	1,296.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
150	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, #689790, 32 oz Spray bottles, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	92	No Bid	\$ 71.40	\$ 119.28	\$ 115.65	No Bid	\$ 103.00	\$ 13.83
151	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, Refill #68978, 128 oz btl, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	144	No Bid	\$ 71.40	\$ 146.08	\$ 162.75	No Bid	\$ 116.00	\$ 16.21
152	SOS pads, 10/bx (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	140	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.32	\$ 0.30	No Bid	\$ 0.44
152.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	140	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.69	No Bid
153	Fiat Urinal Screen Cherry fragrance, Hospital Specialty Co., 12/bx, 6 bx/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	1,224.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.01	\$ 0.76	No Bid	\$ 3.54
153.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	1,224.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.29	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.89	No Bid
154	Toilet Bowl Mop, Unisan UNS8160, 4-1/2" strands of acid-resistant polypropylene; 12" plastic handle (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	197	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.17	\$ 1.10	No Bid	\$ 8.95
154.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	197	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.66	No Bid
155	Toilet Bowl Brush, Rubbermaid #6320, plastic handle; polypropylene fill, 17" L CANNOT consist of any metal parts (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	622	No Bid	\$ 5.08	No Bid	\$ 3.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.61
155.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	622	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
156	Toilet Bowl Brush, Rubbermaid #6310, plastic handle, polypropylene fill, 14.5" long, color: white, 24/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	5,112.00	No Bid	\$ 1.57	\$ 1.72	\$ 3.98	\$ 2.59	No Bid	\$ 3.44
156.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	5,112.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.33	No Bid
157	Renown Stain Mark Eraser #REN05143, 30/cs (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	420	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.29	\$ 1.46	No Bid	\$ 1.85
157.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	420	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
158	Floor Finish, Spartan I-shine Floor finish #SPA4055, 5 gal (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 151.63
158.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one gallon)	Option	gal	55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.28	No Bid	No Bid
159	Cling type bowl cleaner, 24 oz, 12/cs (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	41,184.00	No Bid	\$ 0.10	No Bid	\$ 0.22	\$ 0.08	No Bid	\$ 14.65
159.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	41,184.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
160	Refresh Azure Foaming Hand Soap, dispenser refill bottle, 1000ml, fresh scent, 6/cs #AZU1L (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one case)	Base	cs	192	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.40	No Bid	\$ 57.30	\$ 64.90	\$ 9.28

	Renown Smoke & Odor Eliminator Cleaner, 32oz spray bottle, fresh fragrance, 6/cs, #REN03042-MS (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Base	oz	576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.34	\$ 0.09	No Bid	No Bid
161	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one ounce)	Option	oz	576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.67
	Filmop Door Latch with Hiding Key Compartment for Alpha Workstation (housekeeping carts). Item#0000SM00272. (NO SUBSTITUTION) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
162	Filmop Door Lock Mechanism for Alpha Workstations complete with hardware (1screw Item#30084). Item#0000SM00231 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
163	Filmop replacement 4" casters for Alpha Workstations. Item #23011262 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
164	Item #P1909918U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
165	Filmop Single Hooks #60073U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
166	Filmop Double Hooks #60080U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
167	Filmop Clips #60072U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
168	Shaws Pads Toilet Ring Remover - Environmentally friendly cleaner pads for use on Porcelain toilets, Ceramic tiles and sinks. Works on rust, calcium, lime and water residue build up. 2 pads/package (Enter the cost for one)	Base	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.79
169	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (Enter the cost for one)	Option	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total Extended					\$ 245,992.98	\$ 377,098.20	\$ 453,135.35	\$ 2,622,029.65	\$ 1,066,808.45	\$ 21,984,283.14	\$ 5,064,662.08