

3-Year Contract for the Rental & Cleaning of Officer Uniforms; Spec #51-11/21					
Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.					
All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening.					
No.	Description	Type	UOM	Qty	Cintas
101	Corrections Officer - weekly uniform rental services charge as specified for one Corrections Officer including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	36,660.00	\$18.05
102	Corrections Officers - Kitchen - weekly uniform rental services charge as specified for one Corrections Officer - Kitchen including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	2,340.00	\$18.50
103	Corrections Supervisors - weekly uniform rental services charge as specified for one Corrections Supervisor including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	4,680.00	\$18.05
104	Corrections Supervisors - Kitchen - weekly uniform rental service charge as specified for one Corrections Supervisor - Kitchen including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	312	\$18.50
105	Case Managers and Administrators - weekly uniform rental services charge as specified for one Case Manager and Administrator including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	3,900.00	\$9.00
106	Purchase of Blauer Jacket; Style #6110	Base	Ea	265	\$159.00
106.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
107	Purchase of Officer's Belts, Boston Leather Garrison Belt, silver buckle	Base	Ea	265	\$18.19
107.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
108	Purchase of Supervisor's Belts, Boston Leather Garrison Belt, gold buckle	Base	Ea	265	\$18.19
108	Purchase of Bodek+Rhodes I FlexFit Cap	Base	Ea	265	\$15.49
108.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
109	Purchase of Bodek+Rhodes FlexFit, Adult 6-Panel Trucker Mesh Cap	Base	Ea	265	\$15.49
109.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
110	Purchase of Rocky Style: #2034/234, Slip Stop Black Oxford	Base	Ea	265	\$77.99
110.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
111	Purchase of Rocky Alpha Force Boots, Style #2165/4165	Base	Ea	265	\$92.40
111.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	265	No Bid
112	Purchase of Kitchen Shoes: Rocky #2034-1, Slip Stop Black Oxford	Base	Ea	45	\$77.99
112.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	45	No Bid
113	Dry Cleaning-Jacket	Base	Ea	795	\$10.00

114	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Officers Blauer Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$43.00
115	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Officers Blauer Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$51.00
116	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Supervisors Blauer Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$43.00
117	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Supervisors Blauer Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$51.00
118	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Kitchen Officers Blauer Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$43.00
119	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Kitchen Officers Blauer Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$51.00
120	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Kitchen Supervisors Blauer Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$43.00
121	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Corrections Kitchen Supervisors Blauer Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$51.00
122	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Case Managers and Administrators Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$25.99
123	Department of Corrections LOST GARMENT - Case Managers and Administrators Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$27.99
201	Security Officer Uniforms - weekly uniform rental services charge as specified for one security officer including maintenance, cleaning, delivery and pickup of garments	Base	Week	4,524.00	\$10.18
202	Purchase of Thorogood Style: #834-6888	Base	Ea	87	\$113.40
202.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
203	Purchase of Thorogood Style: #834-6290	Base	Ea	87	\$88.20
203.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
204	Purchase of Reebok 8": #RB8805	Base	Ea	87	\$93.80
204.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
205	Purchase of Rocky Alfa Force Zipper Style: #2173	Base	Ea	87	\$92.40
205.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
206	Purchase of Rocky Alfa Force #2167	Base	Ea	87	\$92.00
206.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
207	Purchase of Rocky Alfa Force Zipper Style: #2168	Base	Ea	87	\$92.00
207.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
208	Purchase of 5.11 8" ATAC: #12391 Side Zip Duty Boot	Base	Ea	87	\$105.00
208.1	Purchase ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Ea	87	No Bid
209	Dry Cleaning-Jacket	Base	Ea	87	\$10.00
210	Security Department-LOST GARMET- Security Officer Elbeco Shirt	Base	Ea	1	\$43.00
211	Security Department-LOST GARMET- Security Officer Elbeco Pants	Base	Ea	1	\$51.00