

3-Year Contract to Provide Bedding & Linen Supplies; Spec #43-09/21																
Line	Description	Type	QTY	Marina Textiles Inc.		Victory Supply Inc		Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.		Standard Textile Co., Inc.		Bob Barker Company Inc		RADG Holdings, LLC		
				Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	
1	Wash Cloth, 12" x 12", 86% cotton / 14% poly blend, 1 lb/dz, heavyweight, 1st quality, 12/cs, color: white, Tabb Textiles #WC185	Base	90000	\$ 0.2080	18,720.00	\$ 0.20	\$ 18,000.00			\$ 0.22	\$ 19,800.00					
1.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	90000		No bid		No bid	\$ 0.20	\$ 18,000.00		No bid	\$ 0.21	\$ 18,900.00	\$ 0.39	\$35,100.00	
2	Wash Cloth, 12" x 12", 100% cotton, 1 lb/dz, 12/cs, color: white	Base	90720	\$ 0.1542	13,989.02	\$ 0.18	\$ 16,329.60	\$ 0.20	\$ 18,144.00	\$ 0.19	\$ 17,236.80	\$ 0.30	\$ 27,216.00	\$ 0.40	\$36,288.00	
3	Terry Towel, 24" x 50", 85% cotton / 15% poly, 10 lb/dz, heavyweight, 1st quality, 12/cs, color: white, Medline #MDTBT4B10R	Base	47820	\$ 1.9125	91,455.75	\$ 1.91	\$ 91,336.20			\$ 3.36	\$ 160,675.20					
3.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	47820		No bid		No bid	\$ 2.10	\$ 100,422.00		No bid	\$ 2.03	\$ 97,074.60	\$ 3.15	\$150,633.00	
4	Terry Towel, 25" x 50", 100% cotton, 1st quality; 13 lb/dz, 12/cs, color: white	Base	36000	\$ 1.9166	68,997.60	\$ 3.25	\$ 117,000.00	\$ 4.33	\$ 155,880.00	\$ 3.65	\$ 131,400.00	\$ 2.68	\$ 96,480.00	\$ 4.15	\$149,400.00	
<b>No Award</b>																
5	Bath Towel, 27" x 54", 100% cotton, 17 lb/dz, 12/cs, color: white	Base	432		No bid		No bid				No bid	\$ 5.15	\$ 2,224.80	\$ 5.40	\$2,332.80	
6	Bath Blanket, multi-purpose, 66" x 90", 80% cotton / 20% poly blend, loom-woven, 1.6 lb/dz, color: white with color borders	Base	360	\$ 4.0000	1,440.00		No bid				No bid		No bid	\$ 6.60	\$2,376.00	
7	Pillow, 21" x 27", non-flammable, poly filled, Staph check	Base	600		No bid		No bid			\$ 3.90	\$ 2,340.00		No bid	\$ 65.00	\$39,000.00	
8	Pillow Case, 20½" x 31 ¾", T180, standard size, 50% cotton / 50% polyester blend, 12/cs, color: bleached white	Base	6132	\$ 0.9166	5,620.59	\$ 1.25	\$ 7,665.00			\$ 0.94	\$ 5,764.08	\$ 1.05	\$ 6,438.60	\$ 1.00	\$6,132.00	
9	Flat Sheet, 54" x 90", T180, Twin, 55% cotton / 45% polyester blend, 12/cs, color: white	Base	12972	\$ 2.7500	35,673.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 38,916.00	\$ 2.91	\$ 37,748.52	\$ 4.07	\$ 52,796.04	\$ 3.78	\$ 49,034.16	\$ 3.30	\$42,807.60	
10	Flat Sheet, 66" x 104", T-180, regular flat, 50% cotton / 50% polyester blend, 12/cs, Color: white	Base	5400	\$ 3.5000	18,900.00	\$ 3.75	\$ 20,250.00	\$ 3.58	\$ 19,332.00	\$ 4.07	\$ 21,978.00	\$ 5.54	\$ 29,916.00	\$ 4.30	\$23,220.00	

3-Year Contract to Provide Bedding & Linen Supplies; Spec #43-09/21															
Line	Description	Type	QTY	Marina Textiles Inc.		Victory Supply Inc		Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.		Standard Textile Co., Inc.		Bob Barker Company Inc		RADG Holdings, LLC	
11	Fitted Sheet, T180, Twin, 55% cotton / 45% polyester blend, 12/cs, color: white, 36"x75"x6"	Base	72	No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 5.10	\$ 367.20	\$ 3.42	\$ 246.24	\$ 3.30	\$237.60
12	Contour Sheet, 36" x 84" x 9", fitted, 50% cotton / 50% polyester blend, cotton/knitted soft, 12/cs, color: solid colors	Base	1800	\$ 3.3333	5,999.94	No bid		No bid		\$ 7.12	\$ 12,816.00	No bid		\$ 4.10	\$7,380.00
13	Percale Contour Sheet, 54" x 80" x 9", T-180, fitted 50% cotton / 50% polyester blend, color: blue	Base	108	No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 7.95	\$ 858.60	No bid		\$ 5.40	\$583.20
14	Muslin Draw Sheet, 54" x 72" or 54" x 81" 55% cotton / 45% polyester blend, 12/cs, colors: solid colors and/or white	Base	72	No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 2.15	\$ 154.80	No bid		\$ 2.70	\$194.40
15	Thermal Blanket, 66" x 90", snag free, 100% cotton heavyweight thermal weave, 12/cs, color: white	Base	3672	\$ 6.0000	22,032.00	\$ 6.16	\$ 22,619.52	\$ 5.25	\$ 19,278.00	\$ 6.15	\$ 22,582.80	\$ 7.82	\$ 28,715.04	\$ 7.30	\$26,805.60
16	Thermal Blanket, 74" x 108", snag free, 100% cotton heavyweight thermal weave, 12/cs color: blue	Base	1080	No bid		No bid		\$ 9.95	\$ 10,746.00	\$ 8.75	\$ 9,450.00	No bid		\$ 24.25	\$26,190.00
17	Cozy Blanket, 66" x 90", color: gray w/ blue striping, 15/cs, Bob Barker #CZ6690GY	Base	90	No bid		\$ 9.38	\$ 844.20	No bid		No bid		\$ 8.06	\$ 725.40	No bid	
17.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	90	No bid		No bid		\$ 6.75	\$ 607.50	No bid		No bid		\$ 150.65	\$13,558.50
18	Wheelchair underpads, 18" x 24", reusable, quilted with square corners and vinyl knit barrier, 55% cotton / 45% polyester face fabric, face color: white, 12/cs, Medline #MDTIU3TABPNK	Base	120	No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 4.80	\$ 576.00	No bid		\$ 3.30	\$396.00
18.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	120	No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 4.80	\$ 576.00	No bid		\$ 3.30	\$396.00
<b>No Award</b>															
19	Anti-Suicide blanket, (Suicide blanket), 54" x 80" tear resistant material, flame retardant, 650-denier polyester fabric & Velcro, color: Sherwood Green, Bob Barker Life Line Blanket, #SB5480	Base	18	No bid		No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 83.00	\$ 1,494.00	No bid	
19.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	18	No bid		No bid		No bid		No bid		No bid		\$ 161.95	\$2,915.10

3-Year Contract to Provide Bedding & Linen Supplies; Spec #43-09/21											
Line	Description	Type	QTY	Marina Textiles Inc.	Victory Supply Inc	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	Standard Textile Co., Inc.	Bob Barker Company Inc	RADG Holdings, LLC		
20	Polyester Core Mattress, 36" x 75" x 6", 6" finished height, color: dark green, Bob Barker Flame Chek #63675	Base	9	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 68.37 \$ 615.33	No bid		
20.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	9	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 180.40	\$1,623.60	
21	Pillow 20" x 26", Lightweight Poly Core / Vinyl, Flame-resistant core of 100% poly fiber. PVC coated taffeta knit cover, Wipe clean (soap & water), 4/cs, Bob Barker #PS2026	Base	12	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.62 \$ 43.44	\$ 7.19 \$ 86.28	No bid		
21.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	12	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 51.85	\$622.20	
<b>Award Total</b>				<b>\$242,075.91</b>	<b>\$38,250.00</b>	<b>\$30,631.50</b>	<b>\$11,342.28</b>	<b>\$2,441.85</b>			
Advertised in Newspaper											
Posted on PennBid											
42 Planholders											
6 Responses											
Apparent Low Bidder											
Recommended for Award											