

3-Year Contract to Provide Patient Personal Care Supplies; Spec #41-09/21										
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Quantity	Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Reidy Medical Supply, Inc.		Agathos Laboratories Inc	
					Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost	Unit Cost	Extended Cost
1	Body Wash & Shampoo, 8 fl. oz. btl, 48/cs, Brand: Dermarite #DER0028	Base	oz	288,000	\$0.0675	\$ 19,440.00	\$0.5900	\$ 169,920.00	\$0.8500	\$ 244,800.00
1.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	288,000	No bid		No bid		No bid	
2	Roll-On Antiperspirant, 1.5 oz., no alcohol, Fresh scent, 96/cs, Brand: McKesson #23-DR15	Base	oz	2,160	No bid		No bid		\$0.3957	\$ 854.71
2.2	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	2,160	No bid		\$0.3810	\$ 822.96	No bid	
3	Toothbrush, 30-Tuft Soft, Full Head, individually wrapped, 144/cs, Brand: Colgate #CG 55501	Base	ea	6,480	\$0.2700	\$ 1,749.60	No bid		\$0.5264	\$ 3,411.07
3.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	6,480	No bid		\$0.0450	\$ 291.60	No bid	
4	Toothpaste, Personal Size, 1.5 oz tube, Mint Flavor with Fluoride, 144/cs, Brand: Nature Mint #FM15	Base	oz	9,720	No bid		No bid		No bid	
4.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	9,720	No bid		\$0.2900	\$ 2,818.80	\$0.3800	\$ 3,693.60
No Award										
5	Alcohol-Free Mouthwash, Mint Flavor, 4 oz. Plastic bottle, 60/cs, Brand: McKesson #150-MW4OZ	Base	oz	22,800	No bid		No bid		\$0.3911	\$ 8,917.08
5.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	22,800	No bid		\$0.4620	\$ 10,533.60	No bid	
6	Overnight Denture Cleanser Tablets, Mint Flavor, Antibacterial, 90/bx, 24 bx/cs, Brand: Freshmint #DENT90	Base	ea	60,480	No bid		\$0.0367	\$ 2,219.62	\$0.0477	\$ 2,884.90
6.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	60,480	No bid		No bid		No bid	
7	Oral Swabsticks, Unflavored, individually wrapped 250/bx, 4 bx/cs, Brand: Dynarex #DYN1218	Base	ea	18,000	\$0.0608	\$ 1,094.40	\$0.0727	\$ 1,308.60	\$0.1034	\$ 1,861.20
7.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	18,000	No bid		No bid		No bid	
8	Denture Adhesive Cream, Zinc-free formulation, 2 oz tube, 72/cs, Brand: Freshmint #DA2	Base	oz	30,960	No bid		\$1.6400	\$ 50,774.40	\$2.2381	\$ 69,291.58
8.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	30,960	No bid		No bid		No bid	
9	Plastic Combs, 7 inch, 36/bg, 40bg/cs, Brand: McKesson #16-C7	Base	ea	8,640	No bid		No bid		\$0.0316	\$ 273.02
9.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	8,640	No bid		\$0.0290	\$ 250.56	No bid	
10	Vented Hair Brushes, Plastic bristles, round tips, 1/bg, 12bg/bx, 24bx/cs, Brand: Dukal #DUKHB02	Base	ea	1,152	No bid		\$0.3370	\$ 388.22	\$0.4804	\$ 553.42
10.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1,152	No bid		No bid		No bid	
11	Emery Boards, 4.25" length, 144/cs, Brand: Graham Fields #1778	Base	ea	9,360	\$0.0357	\$ 334.15	No bid		\$0.0711	\$ 665.50
11.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	9,360	No bid		\$0.0230	\$ 215.28	No bid	
12	Nail Clipper, Toe, with file, 12/bx, 12/cs, Brand: Dynarex #DYN4893	Base	ea	2,592	\$0.4600	\$ 1,192.32	No bid		\$0.7740	\$ 2,006.21
12.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	2,592	No bid		\$0.6370	\$ 1,651.10	No bid	
13	Razors, Disposable, Twin Blade, 50/bx, 2bx/cs, Brand: McKesson #16-RZ50	Base	ea	5,000	No bid		No bid		\$0.1117	\$ 558.50
13.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	5,000	No bid		\$0.1640	\$ 820.00	No bid	
14	Brushless Shave Cream, 11 oz. can, 12/cs, Brand: Dynarex #DYN4249	Base	oz	11,220	\$0.1110	\$ 1,245.42	No bid		\$1.3641	\$ 15,305.20
14.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	11,220	No bid		\$1.9700	\$ 22,103.40	No bid	
15	Dove Soap, 3.15 oz. bars, Individually wrapped, 48/cs Brand: Dove #DVOCB614243 No Substitute	Base	ea	480	No bid		\$2.9300	\$ 1,406.40	\$3.2589	\$ 1,564.27
16	Moisturizing Lotion, 8 fl oz. btl, 48/cs, Brand: Dermarite #DER00128	Base	oz	34,560	\$0.04	\$ 1,482.62	\$0.5210	\$ 18,005.76	\$0.5014	\$ 17,328.38
16.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	34,560	No bid		No bid		No bid	
17	Shower Caps, Disposable, Individually bagged, One size fits most, clear, 200/bx	Base	ea	2,400	No bid		\$0.1710	\$ 410.40	\$0.9044	\$ 2,170.56
18	Body Wash & Shampoo, enriched with Shea Butter, 1 gal bottles, 4/cs, Brand: Dermarite #DER0017	Base	gal	880	\$6.8000	\$ 5,984.00	\$7.6800	\$ 6,758.40	\$7.7275	\$ 6,800.20
18.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	880	No bid		No bid		No bid	

