

18-Month Contract for Snow and Ice Removal Services; Spec #42-10/21										
Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.										
All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening.										
No.	Description	UOM	QTY	Beard and Boards Handyman	LCS Management Group LLC	P.J.G. Property Maintenance Inc.	M & M Lawn Care East	Absolutely Perfect Inc	Syron Co.	Effluent Retrieval inc.
<b>Group 1-Priority Service Sites</b>										
101	FORENSIC FACILITY- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	\$500.00	No bid	\$400.00	\$900.00	\$1,025.00	\$720.00
101.1	Forensic Facility-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	\$600.00	No bid	\$550.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,235.00	\$820.00
101.2	Forensic Facility-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	4	No Bid	\$650.00	No bid	\$750.00	\$300.00	\$400.00	\$1,290.00
101.3	Forensic Facility-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	4	No Bid	\$775.00	No bid	\$1,000.00	\$475.00	\$515.00	\$1,590.00
101.4	Forensic Facility-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$150.00	No bid	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$200.00
102	EMERGENCY SERVICES BUILDING- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	\$600.00	No bid	\$550.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,450.00	\$999.00
102.1	Emergency Services Building-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	\$740.00	No bid	\$600.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,700.00	\$1,149.00
102.2	Emergency Services Building-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	7	No Bid	\$800.00	No bid	\$850.00	\$350.00	\$400.00	\$1,749.00
102.3	Emergency Services Building-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$925.00	No bid	\$1,250.00	\$600.00	\$675.00	\$1,949.00
102.4	Emergency Services Building-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$150.00	No bid	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$275.00	\$250.00
201	D.C. 07-1-01 GALLAGHER- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$276.00	\$325.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,150.00	\$1,299.00
201.1	D.C. 07-1-01 Gallagher-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$389.00	\$425.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,325.00	\$1,799.00
201.2	D.C. 07-1-01 Gallagher-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$611.00	\$550.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$2,549.00
201.3	D.C. 07-1-01 Gallagher-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,097.00	\$850.00	\$600.00	\$700.00	\$2,799.00
201.4	D.C. 07-1-01 Gallagher-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$129.00	\$125.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	\$500.00
202	D.C. 07-1-07 BARANOSKI- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$219.00	\$300.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,250.00	\$499.00
202.1	D.C. 07-1-07 Baranoski-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$341.00	\$400.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,500.00	\$599.00
202.2	D.C. 07-1-07 Baranoski-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$563.00	\$525.00	\$175.00	\$300.00	\$999.00
202.3	D.C. 07-1-07 Baranoski-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$989.00	\$800.00	\$500.00	\$650.00	\$1,299.00
202.4	D.C. 07-1-07 Baranoski-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$123.00	\$125.00	\$100.00	\$125.00	\$200.00
203	D.C. 07-1-08 KELLY- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$259.00	\$375.00	\$950.00	\$1,100.00	\$699.00
203.1	D.C. 07-1-08 Kelly-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$345.00	\$475.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,350.00	\$799.00
203.2	D.C. 07-1-08 Kelly-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$589.00	\$550.00	\$200.00	\$325.00	\$1,465.00
203.3	D.C. 07-1-08 Kelly-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,053.00	\$825.00	\$400.00	\$475.00	\$1,765.00
203.4	D.C. 07-1-08 Kelly-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$126.00	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$225.00
204	D.C. 07-1-03 K. WAGNER- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$174.00	\$300.00	\$950.00	\$1,050.00	\$490.00
204.1	D.C. 07-1-03 K. Wagner-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$245.00	\$425.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,300.00	\$500.00
204.2	D.C. 07-1-03 K. Wagner-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$346.00	\$500.00	\$200.00	\$325.00	\$975.00
204.3	D.C. 07-1-03 K. Wagner-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$597.00	\$800.00	\$400.00	\$600.00	\$1,275.00
204.4	D.C. 07-1-03 K. Wagner-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$92.00	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
301	D.C. 07-1-11 KRONNAGEL- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$269.00	\$450.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,200.00	\$800.00

301.1	D.C. 07-1-11 Kronnagel-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$397.00	\$575.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,450.00	\$1,500.00
301.2	D.C. 07-1-11 Kronnagel-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$646.00	\$625.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$2,100.00
301.3	D.C. 07-1-11 Kronnagel-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,167.00	\$1,100.00	\$700.00	\$775.00	\$2,400.00
301.4	D.C. 07-1-11 Kronnagel-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$146.00	\$125.00	\$150.00	\$200.00	\$400.00
302	D.C. 07-1-10 VISLOSKY- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$315.00	\$400.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,300.00	\$500.00
302.1	D.C. 07-1-10 Vislosky-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$423.00	\$525.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,500.00	\$650.00
302.2	D.C. 07-1-10 Vislosky-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$674.00	\$575.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$1,149.00
302.3	D.C. 07-1-10 Vislosky-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,123.00	\$1,000.00	\$700.00	\$750.00	\$1,449.00
302.4	D.C. 07-1-10 Vislosky-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$149.00	\$125.00	\$150.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
303	D.C. 07-1-04 WAGNER- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$239.00	\$400.00	\$900.00	\$1,100.00	\$500.00
303.1	D.C. 07-1-04 Wagner-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$347.00	\$550.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,250.00	\$560.00
303.2	D.C. 07-1-04 Wagner-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$583.00	\$625.00	\$200.00	\$300.00	\$1,010.00
303.3	D.C. 07-1-04 Wagner-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,061.00	\$950.00	\$700.00	\$850.00	\$1,310.00
303.4	D.C. 07-1-04 Wagner-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$122.00	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
401	D.C. 07-1-09 FINELLO- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	\$540.00	No bid	\$400.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,200.00	\$800.00
401.1	D.C. 07-1-09 Finello-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	\$640.00	No bid	\$525.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,450.00	\$999.00
401.2	D.C. 07-1-09 Finello-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	\$700.00	No bid	\$575.00	\$375.00	\$425.00	\$1,549.00
401.3	D.C. 07-1-09 Finello-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$825.00	No bid	\$900.00	\$800.00	\$850.00	\$1,849.00
401.4	D.C. 07-1-09 Finello-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$150.00	No bid	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$225.00	\$250.00
402	D.C. 07-2-02 DOUPLE- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	\$540.00	No bid	\$425.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,225.00	\$800.00
402.1	D.C. 07-2-02 Double-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	\$640.00	No bid	\$575.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,425.00	\$999.00
402.2	D.C. 07-2-02 Double-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	\$700.00	No bid	\$650.00	\$375.00	\$450.00	\$1,449.00
402.3	D.C. 07-2-02 Double-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$825.00	No bid	\$975.00	\$800.00	\$900.00	\$1,599.00
402.4	D.C. 07-2-02 Double-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	\$150.00	No bid	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$275.00	\$250.00
501	D.C. 07-3-01 SNOW- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$950.00	\$1,100.00	\$800.00
501.1	D.C. 07-3-01 Snow-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,100.00	\$1,275.00	\$999.00
501.2	D.C. 07-3-01 Snow-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$200.00	\$300.00	\$1,449.00
501.3	D.C. 07-3-01 Snow-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$500.00	\$650.00	\$1,649.00
501.4	D.C. 07-3-01 Snow-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$150.00	\$200.00	\$250.00
502	D.C. 07-3-03 GAMBARDELLA- Salt only	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,300.00	\$1,350.00	\$800.00
502.1	D.C. 07-3-03 Gambardella-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,800.00	\$2,000.00	\$999.00
502.2	D.C. 07-3-03 Gambardella-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$400.00	\$500.00	\$1,449.00
503.3	D.C. 07-3-03 Gambardella-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,200.00	\$1,350.00	\$1,649.00
503.4	D.C. 07-3-03 Gambardella-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$500.00	\$650.00	\$250.00
504	D.C. 07-2-05 GAIER- Salt only	Ea	1	\$460.00	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,300.00	\$1,450.00	\$1,180.00
504.1	D.C. 07-2-05 Gaier-Salt and shovel	Ea	1	\$775.00	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$1,600.00	\$1,700.00	\$1,480.00
504.2	D.C. 07-2-05 Gaier-Snow/ice removal 2 inches or more, but less than 5 inches	Ea	12	\$1,020.00	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$300.00	\$450.00	\$1,930.00
504.3	D.C. 07-2-05 Gaier-Snow/ice removal 5 inches or more, but less than 8 inches	Ea	1	\$1,320.00	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$900.00	\$1,050.00	\$2,280.00
504.4	D.C. 07-2-05 Gaier-Snow/ice removal 1 inch increment over 8 inches	Ea	1	\$350.00	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$400.00

601.1	Discount for multiple location award- this discount will be applied to each location awarded when a bidder is awarded two or more locations	Percent	1	0	0	10%	0	2%	1.50%	0
601.2	Hourly rate for Labor Cost for Extraordinary and Special Circumstances as specified in bid	Hr	1	\$125.00	\$150.00	\$45.00	\$175.00	\$75.00	\$95.00	\$65.00
601.3	Hourly rate for relocation of snow due to extreme snowfall to location on County property	Hr	1	\$185.00	\$150.00	\$175.00	\$300.00	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$250.00
601.4	Hourly rate for removal of snow due to extreme snowfall from County property	Hr	1	\$215.00	\$200.00	\$150.00	\$550.00	\$500.00	\$650.00	\$500.00
	Total Extended			\$15,670.00	\$36,575.00	\$60,736.00	\$96,850.00	\$87,375.02	\$108,240.02	\$293,289.00