

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																			
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
Bandages																			
1	Band-Aids, Flexible Fabric Bandages, 1" x 3", with non-stick pad, Sterile, Latex-free, 100/box, 24 boxes/case, Brand: Dukal #4444-IMC	Base	Ea	NM	16800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0200	336.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0431	724.08				
1.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		16800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0145	243.60	0.0200	336.00	No Bid	No Bid		
2	Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandages, 3" x 4.1 yds. Non Sterile, 12 rolls/box, 8 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #3103	Base	Ea	NM	3648	No Bid	No Bid	0.1200	437.76	0.0980	357.50	0.1070	390.34	0.1130	412.22	0.1096	399.82		
2.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		3648	No Bid	0.3200	1,167.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
3	Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandages, 4" x 4.1 yds. Non Sterile, 12 rolls/box, 8 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #3104	Base	Ea	NM	5568	No Bid	No Bid	0.1300	723.84	0.1150	640.32	0.1220	679.30	0.1310	729.41	0.1283	714.37		
3.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		5568	No Bid	0.3200	1,781.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
4C	Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: Medigrip, #MSC9502 Size C	Base	Ea	NM	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	56.4830	338.90
4C.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	48.0800	288.48	27.6700	166.02	No Bid	No Bid		
4D	Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: Medigrip, #MSC9503 Size D	Base	Ea	NM	100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.6223	5,362.23
4D.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	48.0800	4,808.00	31.5400	3,154.00	No Bid	No Bid		
4E	Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: Medigrip, #MSC9504 Size E	Base	Ea	NM	120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	73.1641	8,779.69
4E.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	62.0400	7,444.80	23.8100	2,857.20	No Bid	No Bid		
4F	Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: Medigrip, #MSC9505 Size F	Base	Ea	NM	75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	72.1115	5,408.36
4F.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	72.0000	5,400.00	38.9300	2,919.75	No Bid	No Bid		
4G	Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: Medigrip, #MSC9506 Size G	Base	Ea	NM	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	103.6409	4,145.64
4G.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	86.9900	3,479.60	45.0000	1,800.00	No Bid	No Bid		
5	Gauze Surgical Sponges, 4" x 4", 8 ply, Non Sterile, 200/sleeve, 10 sleeves/case, Brand: Dynarex #3242	Base	Ea	NM	140000	No Bid	No Bid	0.0147	2,058.00	0.0150	2,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0139	1,946.00
5.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		140000	No Bid	0.0200	2,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0240	3,360.00	0.0150	2,100.00	No Bid	No Bid		
6	Gauze Sponges, 4" x 4", 8 ply, 100% cotton, Sterile, 2/pack, 50 packs/box, 12 boxes/case, Brand: Caring #PRM4408	Base	Ea	NM	7200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0499	359.28
6.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		7200	No Bid	0.0480	345.60	No Bid	0.0289	208.08	0.0587	422.64	0.0570	410.40	No Bid	No Bid		

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																			
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
7	Drain Sponges, 4" x 4", 6 ply, Non Woven, Sterile 2/pack, 25 packs/box 12 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #4611	Base	Ea	NM	45000	No Bid	No Bid	0.0840	3,780.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0704	3,168.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0503	2,263.50		
7.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		45000	No Bid	0.0480	2,160.00	No Bid	0.0374	1,683.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.1120	5,040.00	No Bid	No Bid		
8	Sterile, 20/box, 20 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #3501	Base	Ea	NM	17600	No Bid	No Bid	0.1075	1,892.00	0.0978	1,721.28	0.0939	1,652.64	No Bid	No Bid	0.0872	1,534.72		
8.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		17600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1260	2,217.60	No Bid	No Bid		
9	Bandages, 1" x 3", fabric, sterile, latex-free, adhesive, 100/box, Brand: Stat-strip #15215	Base	Ea	HD	4800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0350	168.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0304	145.92		
9.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		4800	No Bid	0.0499	239.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0200	96.00	0.0200	96.00	No Bid	No Bid		
10	Gauze, 2" x 2", 8-ply surgical sponges, non-sterile, color: white, 200/pack	Base	Ea	HD	100000	No Bid	0.0075	750.00	No Bid	0.0035	350.00	0.0039	390.00	0.0050	500.00	0.0004	40.00		
Wound Care																			
11	Non-Adhering Dressing 3" x 8", 24/box, 6 boxes/case Oil Emulsion, Brand: Shur-Conform #DKC77042	Base	Ea	NM	4320	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5980	2,583.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.6667	2,880.14		
11.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		4320	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.8129	3,511.73	0.6700	2,894.40	No Bid	No Bid		
12	Tegaderm Transparent Dressing, 4" x 4 3/4", 50/box, Brand: 3M #1626W	Base	Ea	NM	2000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5000	3,000.00	0.6750	1,350.00	1.3200	2,640.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.9228	1,845.60		
12.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		2000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.6500	1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid		
13	No Sting Skin Prep Wipes, 50/box, 20 boxes/case, Brand: Smith & Nephew #594 20600	Base	Ea	NM	20000	No Bid	No Bid	0.0245	490.00	0.2750	5,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5303	10,606.00		
13.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		20000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1744	3,488.00	0.1100	2,200.00	No Bid	No Bid		
14	Alcohol Prep Pads, 2-ply, saturated w/ 70% isopropyl alcohol, individual wrapper, sterile, latex-free, 2.5" x 1-1/16", 200/box, School Heath #49251	Base	Ea	NM	200000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0063	1,260.00		
14.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		200000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0072	1,440.00	0.0075	1,500.00	0.0070	1,400.00	No Bid	No Bid		
15	Alcohol Prep Pads, 2-ply, saturated w 70% isopropyl alcohol, individual wrapper, sterile, latex-free, 2.5" x 1-1/16", 200/pack, Covidien Curity #5750	Base	Ea	HD	100000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0075	750.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0059	590.00		
15.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		100000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0072	720.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0070	700.00	No Bid	No Bid		
16	Micropore Tape 1" paper tape, 12 rolls/box, 12 boxes/case, Brand: 3M #1530-1, No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	1440	No Bid	No Bid	0.4125	594.00	0.4125	594.00	0.4216	607.10	0.4310	620.64	0.4499	647.86		

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21

Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
17	Transpore Tape 1", Plastic, 12 rolls/box, 12 boxes/case, Brand: 3M #1527-1 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	1440	No Bid	No Bid	0.7500	1,080.00	0.7500	1,080.00	0.8039	1,157.62	0.8290	1,193.76	0.8648	1,245.31		
18	Wound closure-Steri-strips, flesh tone color, 1/4" x 4", 10/pack, 200 packs/box, Brand: 3M #R1546 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	10000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		0.3072	3,072.00	0.1032	1,032.00	1.2100	12,100.00	0.1264	1,264.00		
19	Super Soft Heel Protectors, Brand: Skill Care #503410	Base	Ea	NM	20	No Bid	No Bid	52.0000	1,040.00	44.2000	884.00	50.9100	1,018.20	No Bid		53.6563	1,073.13		
19.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		16.4900	329.80	No Bid			
20	Povidone Iodine Swabsticks, saturated w/ 10% povidone iodine solution, individual wrapper, 50 each/box, Brand: Dynarex #DYN1201	Base	Ea	NM	3500	No Bid	No Bid	0.0970	339.50	0.9200	3,220.00	No Bid		No Bid		0.1028	359.80		
20.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		3500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		0.2184	764.40	0.1530	535.50	No Bid			
21	Staple Removal Kit, Staple w/ gauze strip, Brand: Dynarex #4522	Base	Ea	NM	40	No Bid	No Bid	0.9400	37.60	0.8300	33.20	0.8800	35.20	0.9100	36.40	0.7296	29.18		
21.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		40	No Bid	2.0000	80.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
22	Suture Removal Kit, Sterile, Includes: littauer Scissors, plastic forceps-4inch, and gauze sponge 3"x3", Brand: Dukal #15100	Base	Ea	NM	24	No Bid	No Bid	0.6000	14.40	0.5100	12.24	No Bid		0.5800	13.92	0.5184	12.44		
22.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		24	No Bid	2.0000	48.00	No Bid	No Bid		0.6000	14.40	No Bid		No Bid			
23	Lambs Wool, Padding, 100% Genuine Lambs Wool, 3/8 oz, Brand: Sunmark #2264315	Base	Ea	NM	240	No Bid	No Bid	2.6500	636.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		13.1125	3,147.00		
23.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1.6500	396.00	No Bid		1.6200	388.80	No Bid			
24	Plastic "shoe" boxes (used for wound care supply storage), 13" x 8" x 5", 6 quarts, Secure snap-on lid, Clear, 12 each/case Brand: Sterilite #12 X 16428012	Base	Ea	NM	192	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
24.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		192	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		3.4350	659.52	No Bid			
25	Plastic storage box (used for wound care supply storage), 16" x 12" x 7", 16 quarts, Secure snap-on lid, Clear, 12 each/case, Brand: Sterilite #16448012	Base	Ea	NM	144	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
25.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		144	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
Fall Prevention																			
26	Body Wedge Disposable Foam 8" x 11" x 22", 8 each/case, Brand: Medline #NON081245	Base	Ea	NM	400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		11.5619	4,624.76
26.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		4.5340	1,813.60	No Bid			

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																				
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions		
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost
27	Bed Disposable Foam Positioning Wedges, 7.5" x 7.5" x 17", 8 each/case, Brand: Medline #NON081244	Base	Ea	NM	400	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			7.3174	2,926.96
27.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		400	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		18.2000	7,280.00	No Bid		4.5340	1,813.60		No Bid	
28	Bedside Fall Prevention Mat, 24" x 70" x 0.75", Ultra Low, beveled edge, Color: Burgundy woven pattern; Brand: Arrowhead #ARRP107350-24-06 (Base	Ea	NM	15	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		55.5500	833.25	No Bid		No Bid			93.7500	1,406.25
28.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		15	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		122.9300	1,843.95	46.2400	693.60		No Bid	
29	Bed Rail Wedge, Brand: Skil Care, #4021240	Base	Ea	NM	50	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		50.0000	2,500.00	No Bid		58.0600	2,903.00	105.3125	5,265.63	
29.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		50	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid	
30	Protech Alarm Monitor, Pull Cord w/ magnet, Color: cream, battery powered, Brand: Dynarex #P-800100	Base	Ea	NM	115	No Bid		No Bid	10.7500	1,236.25	10.0000	1,150.00	No Bid			9.8300	1,130.45	11.7523	1,351.51	
30.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		115	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		25.9200	2,980.80	No Bid				No Bid	
Liquids & Solutions																				
31	Distilled Water, 1 gallon container, 6 containers/case, Brand: Crystal Spring #79765-02000	Base	Gal	NM	60	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		0.7200	43.20	No Bid		No Bid		1.3415	80.49
31.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Gal		60	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		3.8800	232.80	2.4500	147.00		No Bid
32	Hydrogen Peroxide Solution 10 volume, Local antiseptic, 16 oz plastic bottle, 12 bottles/case, Brand: Swan #0869 0871 43	Base	Oz	NM	1920	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0391	75.07
32.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Oz		1920	No Bid	1.4900	2,860.80	No Bid		0.0290	55.68	No Bid		No Bid	0.0410	78.72		No Bid	
33	Sodium Chloride Irrigation Solution, 0.9%, 250 ml bottle, 24 bottles/case, Brand: Baxter #2F7122	Base	ml	NM	360000	No Bid	3.9500	1,422,000.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0047	1,692.00
33.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	ml		360000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.0050	1,800.00	No Bid		No Bid	0.0050	1,800.00		No Bid	
34	Sterile Water for Irrigation, 250 ml/bottle, 24 bottles/case, Brand: Baxter #2F7112	Base	ml	NM	312000	No Bid	3.9500	1,232,400.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0046	1,435.20
34.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	ml		312000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.0046	1,435.20	1.3970	435,864.00	0.0050	1,560.00			No Bid	
35	Odor Eliminator ByeByeOdor, 8 oz bottle, 48 bottles/case, Brand: Dermarite #00258	Base	oz	NM	17280	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.1680	2,903.04	1.3360	23,086.08	0.1130	1,952.64			0.1250	2,160.00
35.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	oz		17280	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid				No Bid	
36	Humidifier Pre-Filled Bottles, Sterile Water, 500 ml, 12 bottles/case, Brand: Care Fusion-Air Life #CAR002620	Base	ml	NM	1200000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.0043	5,160.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0073	8,760.00
36.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	ml		1200000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		1.4240	1,708,800.00	0.0020	2,400.00			No Bid	

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																				
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions		
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost
Syringes/Needles																				
37	Insulin Safety Syringe, 1 ml, 29g x ½", 100/box, Brand: Kendall #8881511110, No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	45000	No Bid	0.2995	13,477.50	0.2923	13,153.50	0.1844	8,298.00	0.2328	10,476.00	0.1770	7,965.00	0.1750	7,875.00		
38	TB safety Syringes, 1 ml, 28g x 1.2", 100/box, Brand: Kendall #8881511201	Base	Ea	NM	1200	No Bid	0.2995	359.40	0.2820	338.40	0.2150	258.00	0.2471	296.52	0.2460	295.20	0.1806	216.72		
38.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1200	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
39	Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, sterile, latex-free, 3cc 23g x 1", 100/box, Brand: BD #305271 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	200	No Bid	0.5995	2,517.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5180	2,175.60	0.5324	2,236.08		
				HD	4000															
					4200															
40	Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, sterile, latex-free, 3cc 25g x 5/8", 100/box, Brand: BD #305269 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	200	No Bid	0.5995	1,079.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5180	932.40	0.5324	958.32		
				HD	1600															
					1800															
41	Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, sterile, latex-free, 3cc 25g x 1", 100/box, Brand: BD #305270 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	200	No Bid	0.5995	2,517.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5180	2,175.60	0.5324	2,236.08		
				HD	4000															
					4200															
42	Needle Only, PrecisionGlide Needle, 25G x 1", Regular Bevel, Sterile, 100/box, Brand: BD #305125 100/BX	Base	Ea	HD	2000	No Bid	0.0999	199.80	0.0750	150.00	0.0740	148.00	No Bid	No Bid	0.0780	156.00	0.0757	151.40		
Urology																				
43	Stat Loc Foley Stabilation Device, Tricol Anchor Pad for Silicone Catheters, 25/case, Brand: Bach #Fol0102	Base	Ea	NM	950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.0000	3,800.00	5.4700	5,196.50	5.1900	4,930.50	No Bid	No Bid	4.3344	4,117.68		
43.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.4300	1,358.50	No Bid	No Bid		
44	Irrigation Tray Sterile Saline Thumb Control Ring Piston Syringe, 60cc Piston Syringe w/ Sterile Saline, 20/case, Brand: Medline #DYNC2303	Base	Ea	NM	2800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.4464	9,649.92		
44.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		2800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0000	5,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3370	943.60	No Bid	No Bid		
45	Fracture Bed Pan, Color: Mauve, 50/case, Brand: Dynarex #4230 (Enter UNIT COST for 1 bed pan)	Base	Ea	NM	1250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.0402	1,300.25		
45.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.7900	987.50	1.3925	1,740.63	1.8650	2,331.25	No Bid	No Bid			

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																			
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
46	Uri-Drain Urinary Extension Tubing w/ Latex, 8.5mm x 18", 24/case, Brand: Kendall #KEN8884731900	Base	Ea	NM	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5200	437.76	No Bid	No Bid	1.6260	468.29	1.6120	464.26		
46.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
47	Urinary Leg Bag with Twist Valve, Large, 1000ml, 12/box, 4 box/case, Brand: Dynarex #4282	Base	Ea	NM	960	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5890	565.44	0.6610	634.56	0.7060	677.76	0.6063	582.05		
47.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		960	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48	Urinary Drain Bag, Anti-Reflux Valve, Sterile, 2000ml, Vinyl, 20/case, Brand: Kenguard #3512	Base	Ea	NM	1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.9560	2,738.40	1.8015	2,522.10	2.0950	2,933.00	1.8000	2,520.00		
48.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
49	Supreme Male Urinal, graduated in ounces and milliliters, 1000ml, 48/case, Brand: Medline #DYND80235S	Base	Ea	NM	2160	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.8045	1,737.72		
49.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		2160	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.4000	864.00	0.6290	1,358.64	0.5740	1,239.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50	Catheter Insertion Tray, Foley without Catheter, without balloon, 20/case, Brand: Dynarex #4927	Base	Ea	NM	500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6800	840.00	1.9590	979.50	1.9530	976.50	1.9164	958.20		
50.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
51	Commode Specimen Collector, Plastic, 1000mL, Unprinted, Non Sterile, 100/case, Brand: GMAX #GS210	Base	Ea	NM	1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3770	377.00	0.4087	408.70		
51.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.4000	400.00	0.7653	765.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	Bariatric Bed Pan w/ Anti-Splash, 1200lb weight capacity, 20 each/case, Brand: Alimed #71125520	Base	Ea	NM	80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.9900	1,439.20	32.0625	2,565.00		
52.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Respiratory																			
53	Nasal Cannula with Ear Cushions, Low Flow Delivery, 7' supply tube, 25/case, Brand: Salter #1600TLC-7-25	Base	Ea	NM	4875	No Bid	No Bid	1.3200	6,435.00	1.1300	5,508.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.9500	4,631.25		
53.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		4875	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.4254	2,073.83	1.2590	6,137.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54	Nasal Cannula, Adult soft touch, 25' tubing and standard connectors, 25/case, Brand: Medline #HCS4515B	Base	Ea	NM	100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.0068	900.68		
54.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.3672	136.72	1.6350	163.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
55	Nebulizer Kit with Aerosol mask, 50 each/case, Brand: Salter #8924-7-50	Base	Ea	NM	1200	No Bid	No Bid	1.3000	1,560.00	1.1300	1,356.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.3124	1,574.88		
55.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.2100	1,452.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																			
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
56	Aerosol Mask Elongated Style, Adult, adjustable head strap, without tubing, 50 each/case, Brand: Salter #8100-0-50	Base	Ea	NM	600	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.4700	282.00	No Bid		No Bid		0.7524	451.44
56.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		600	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		1.4460	867.60	0.4750	285.00	No Bid	
57	Incentive Spirometer, Voldyne 5000, 12each/case Brand: Hudson RCI #8884719009	Base	Ea	NM	240	No Bid		No Bid	8.0000	1,920.00	3.2500	780.00	No Bid			2.5870	620.88	4.6440	1,114.56
57.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		240	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		35.4400	8,505.60	No Bid		No Bid		
58	NonRebreather Oxygen Mask, Elongated Style, Adult, Adjustable head strap, Trumpet connector, 7' oxygen tubing length, 50 each/case, Brand:	Base	Ea	NM	1200	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		1.1400	1,368.00	No Bid		1.7530	2,103.60	1.8100	2,172.00	
58.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1200	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		1.2810	1,537.20	No Bid		No Bid		
59	Oxygen High Concentration Mask, Elongated Style, Adult, Adjustable head strap, Standard Connector, 50 each/case, Brand: Sun Med #8110-7-50	Base	Ea	NM	600	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.6900	414.00	No Bid		1.0010	600.60	1.1124	667.44	
59.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		600	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
60	Bacterial/Viral Respiratory filter, 15 mm ID x 22 mm OD x 22 mm ID, 50 each/case, Brand: AG Industries #HSK864	Base	Ea	NM	1000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	2.1675	2,167.50
60.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1000	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		5.9980	5,998.00	No Bid		
61	Handheld Nebulizer Kit, Small Volume, 10 mL, T-Adapter, Mouthpiece Delivery, 7' oxygen tube length, Medication Cup, 50 each/case Brand: VixOne #3655D-621	Base	Ea	NM	500	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	1.0811	540.55
61.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		500	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.7600	380.00	No Bid		
Biohazard/Sharps Containers																			
62	Sharps In-Room Disposal System, 5-qt container w/ sharpstar lid and counter-balanced door, used in locked wall cabinet, color: red, 20/box, Brand: Kendall #8507SA	Base	Ea	HD	300	No Bid	6.9500	2,085.00	5.0000	1,500.00	No Bid		4.5855	1,375.65	No Bid		No Bid	3.1511	945.33
62.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		300	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		3.5800	1,074.00	No Bid		3.5500	1,065.00	No Bid		
63	Sharps Multi-Purpose Sharps Biohazard Collector, 6.9 qt, 11.5" x 8.75" x 5.5", plastic, color: red, on-piece with regular funnel entry w/ two handles, must not be able to see through container, 12/box, Brand B-D #300467	Base	Ea	HD	252	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	4.7307	1,192.14
63.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		252	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		7.2150	1,818.18	6.9030	1,739.56	No Bid		
Miscellaneous																			

2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies; Spec #31-07/21																			
Line	Description	Type	UOM	Dept	QTY	Medaserv		Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.		DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES		Manheim Medical Supply Inc.		Maven Medical		McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC		Concordance Healthcare Solutions	
						Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended	Unit Cost	Extended
75	Anti-Embolism Stocking, Knee-Length, X-Large, Regular Length, 12 pair/box Brand: Kendall #KEN7604	Base	Pair	NM	48	No Bid	4.1000	196.80	No Bid	6.1200	293.76	6.6500	319.20	6.2330	299.18	3.1362	150.54		
75.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Pair		48	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
76	Drinking Cup, 5oz., Translucent Plastic Disposable Color: clear, 100/pack, 25 packs/case Brand: Dynarex #4255 No Substitute	Base	Ea	NM	825000	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	0.0145	11,962.50	No Bid		0.0160	13,200.00	0.0142	11,715.00		
77	Tongue Depressor, Adult 6" x 11/16", Non-Sterile, 500/box Brand: Pro Advantage #SOL72000	Base	Ea	NM	144	No Bid			0.0100	1.44	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.0083	1.20		
77.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		144	No Bid	0.0180	2.59	No Bid	0.0090	1.30	0.0104	1.50	0.0090	1.30	No Bid			No Bid
78	Instant Cold Pack, Non-toxic General Purpose, 5" x 9" inch Plastic/Urea/Water, Disposable, 24/case, Brand: Dynarex #4518	Base	Ea	NM	2640	No Bid	0.7500	1,980.00	No Bid	0.4400	1,161.60	No Bid		0.4780	1,261.92	0.4851	1,280.66		
78.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		2640	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		0.4958	1,308.91	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
79	Abdominal Binder, 9" with 3 panels, Fits waist size up to 45", Medium, Brand: Dale #DL410	Base	Ea	NM	8	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	13.0000	104.00	No Bid		13.4900	107.92	13.6842	109.47		
79.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		8	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		5.7000	45.60	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
80	Abdominal Binder, 9" with 3 panels. Fits waist size 46" – 62", Large Brand: Dale #DL411	Base	Ea	NM	45	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	14.8500	668.25	No Bid		15.6300	703.35	15.8514	713.31		
80.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		45	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		7.5900	341.55	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
81	Abdominal Binder, 9" with 3 panels, Fits waist size 60" – 75", X-Large, Brand: Dale #DL418	Base	Ea	NM	40	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		20.7600	830.40	21.0526	842.10		
81.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		40	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		7.5900	303.60	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
82	Abdominal Binder, 12" with 4 panels, Fitd waist size 72" – 94", XX-Large Brand: Dale #DL820	Base	Ea	NM	28	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		30.8300	863.24	31.2693	875.54		
82.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		28	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		13.9200	389.76	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
83	Adhesive Remover Pad, Acetone-Free, Individually wrapped, 100 each/box, 10 box/case, Brand: Medline #MDS090855	Base	Ea	NM	1000	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.1462	146.20		
83.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		1000	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	0.0350	35.00	0.0365	36.50	0.1050	105.00	No Bid			No Bid
84	Elastic Bandage, Knit w/ Velcro clip, 4" x 5 yd, 10 each/box, Brand: Proadvantage #P156004	Base	Ea	NM	140	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.5673	79.42		
84.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		140	No Bid	0.4900	68.60	No Bid	0.6000	84.00	0.5650	79.10	0.7100	99.40	No Bid			No Bid
85	Elastic Bandage, Knit w/ Velcro clip, 6" x 5 yd, 10 each/box, Brand: Proadvantage #P156006	Base	Ea	NM	60	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.8291	49.75		
85.1	Alternate or Equal Product	Option	Ea		60	No Bid	0.7990	47.94	No Bid	0.8300	49.80	0.8780	52.68	1.0690	64.14	No Bid			No Bid

