

OFFICIAL AWARD TABULATION					
1-Year Contract to Provide Disposable Wipes; Spec #03-02/21					
	Line 1	Line 1.1	Line 2	Line 2.1	
	Instant Hand Sanitizing Wipes, Sani-Hands PDI, Mfg #P13472 135/cstr, 12/cs	Alternate or Equal Instant Hand Sanitizing Wipes	Germicidal Disposable Wipe, Super Sani-Cloth PDI, Mfg #Q55172 160/cstr, 12/cs	Alternate or Equal Germicidal Disposable Wipe	Total
Type	Base	Option	Base	Option	
Quantity	1,279,565	1,279,565	260,620	260,620	
Dynasty Group USA LLC	No bid	0.0375 47983.69	No bid	No bid	\$47,983.69
Office Depot	No bid	No bid	No bid	0.0441 11493.34	\$11,493.34
Stalwart Medical Solutions LLC	No bid	No bid	No bid	0.0531 13838.92	\$13,838.92
Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC	No bid	0.0254 32500.95 240/cnst; 12 cnst/cs	No bid	0.0278 7245.24 240/cnstr; 12 cnstr/cs	\$39,746.19
Pennsylvania Paper & Supply Co.	No bid	No bid	No bid	0.0570 14855.3400	\$14,855.34
Spartan Source LLC	No bid	0.0250 31989.13	No bid	0.0344 8965.33	\$40,954.45
TMD Holdings LLC	No bid	No bid	No bid	0.0300 7818.60	\$7,818.60
EVERGREEN USA LLC	No bid	0.0400 51182.60	No bid	0.0200 5212.40	\$56,395.00
United Sales Usa Corp.	No bid	0.0656 83939.46	No bid	No bid	\$83,939.46
Manheim Medical Supply Inc.	0.0356 45552.51	No bid	0.0362 9434.44	No bid	\$54,986.96
Uweport LLC	No bid	0.0299 38258.99	No bid	0.0448 11675.78	\$49,934.77
QYK BRANDS LLC	No bid	0.0415 53101.95	No bid	0.0350 9121.70	\$62,223.65
Zoom Technologies LLC	0.0400 51182.60	No bid	0.0390 10164.18	No bid	\$61,346.78
DEEPKA IMPORT LLC	No bid	0.0450 57580.43	No bid	0.0450 11727.90	\$69,308.33
MEDICA PPE INC	0.0481 61547.0765	No bid	0.0528 13760.7360	No bid	\$75,307.81
PELV-ICE	No bid	0.0560 71655.64	No bid	0.0560 14594.72	\$86,250.36
The Dunk Collection d.b.a Happy Home Health	No bid	0.0380 48623.47	No bid	0.0875 22804.25	\$71,427.72
Mediversal Distributor Group	0.0266 34036.43	0.0230 29430.00	No bid	0.0500 13031.00	\$76,497.42
School Health Corporation	No bid	0.0566 72423.3790	No bid	0.0701 18269.4620	\$90,692.84
SITA BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC	No bid	0.0799 102237.24	No bid	0.0499 13004.94	\$115,242.18
18supply	0.0440 56300.86	No bid	0.0900 23455.80	No bid	\$79,756.66
Headquarters Inc	0.0297 38003.08	0.0425 54381.51	0.0468 12197.02	0.0525 13682.55	\$118,264.16

1-Year Contract to Provide Disposable Wipes; Spec #03-02/21					
	Line 1	Line 1.1	Line 2	Line 2.1	
	Instant Hand Sanitizing Wipes, Sani-Hands PDI, Mfg #P13472 135/cstr, 12/cs	Alternate or Equal Instant Hand Sanitizing Wipes	Germicidal Disposable Wipe, Super Sani-Cloth PDI, Mfg #Q55172 160/cstr, 12/cs	Alternate or Equal Germicidal Disposable Wipe	Total
Type	Base	Option	Base	Option	
Quantity	1,279,565	1,279,565	260,620	260,620	
Vehicle Maintenance Program	0.0900 115160.85	No bid	0.0900 23455.80	No bid	\$138,616.65
pristine dental supplies inc	No bid	0.0830 106203.90	0.1100 28668.20	No bid	\$134,872.10
Green Smart Products	No bid	0.0800 102365.20	No bid	0.0800 20849.60	\$123,214.80
Cintas	0.0600 76773.90	0.0550 70376.08	0.0696 18139.15	0.0606 15793.57	\$181,082.70
Initium Health	0.1406 179906.84	No bid	0.0936 24394.03	0.0450 11727.90	\$216,028.77
Digital Ally, Inc.	0.1400 179139.10	0.0900 115160.85	0.1400 36486.80	0.0900 23455.80	\$354,242.55
Inkjet Inc DBA Community Chemical	No bid	0.0490 62698.69	No bid	No bid	\$62,698.69
Malor & Company Inc	0.0960 122838.24	0.0960 122838.24	0.1142 29762.80	0.0960 25019.52	\$300,458.80
Apparent Low Bidder					
Recommended for Award					