

Contract to Provide Janitorial Supplies; Spec #06-02/21													
Dept	Line	Description	Type	UOM	Qty	QYK BRANDS LLC	The Home Depot Pro	General Chemical & Supply Inc.	Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC	Digital Dolphin Supplies			
GS NM	1	Febreze Air Effects/Air Refresher Spring & Renewal or Fresh Linen fragrance, Proctor & Gamble, 9.7 oz Aerosol, 9/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	Case	33	No Bid	No Bid	19.1400 957.00	27.1500 895.95	No Bid			
								8.8 oz, 6/cs	8.8 oz, 6/cs				
GS	2	Vacuum Belts for Tornado CV-30, Belt #K2884274, 12" upright vacuum cleaner, 10/pk (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	Pk	4	No Bid	No Bid	9.9900 39.96	25.9600 103.84	No Bid			
									2/pk				
GS	3	Disposable bags for Tornado CV-30, Bag #K6904294, 12" upright vacuum cleaner, 10/pk (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	Pk	25	No Bid	No Bid	10.8900 272.25	12.9400 323.50	No Bid			
GS NM	4	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, #689790, 32 oz Spray bottles, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	Case	55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	76.4600 4205.30	126.9100	6980.05		
GS NM	5	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, Refill #68978, 128 oz btl, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	Case	89	No Bid	No Bid	95.1400 8467.46	95.6400 8511.96	164.4900	14639.61		
GS	6	Squeegee, Unisan #UNS922-9	Base	Ea	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	6.1	Alternate or Equal Squeegee, Unisan #UNS922-9	Option	Ea	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	18.8500 113.10	No Bid			
GS	7	Treated Dust Cloths, Chicopee #CHI 0911, 500/cs	Base	Ea	2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.0700	2675.00		
	7.1	Alternate or Equal Treated Dust Cloths, Chicopee #CHI 0911	Option	Ea	2,500	No Bid	No Bid	0.1770 442.50	0.1300 325.00	No Bid			
YC	8	Hoover allergen bag, #H00AH10170 for upright vacuum #CH50102 or #CH50100, 10 bags/pk	Base	Ea	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6100 16.10	2.9900	29.90		
	8.1	Alternate or Equal Hoover allergen bag, #H00AH10170 for upright vacuum #CH50102 or #CH50100	Option	Ea	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
YC	9	Windsor Sensor vacuum bag, #MM5300, 10 bags/pk	Base	Ea	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.8000 138.00	No Bid			
	9.1	Alternate or Equal Windsor Sensor vacuum bag, #MM5300	Option	Ea	10	No Bid	No Bid	11.5600 115.60	No Bid	No Bid			
No Award													
GS	10	3M #7200 Floor stripping pad, or equal, 5/bx	Base	Ea	15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.5800 38.70	10.9900	164.85		
	10.1	Alternate or Equal 3M #7200 Floor stripping pad	Option	Ea	15	No Bid	No Bid	2.4900 37.35	No Bid	No Bid			
GS, NM, DOC	11	Rubbermaid #6320 Toilet Bowl Brush, plastic handle; polypropylene fill, 17"L	Base	Ea	186	No Bid	No Bid	4.4800 833.28	0.8400 156.24	9.1500	1701.90		
	11.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #6320 Toilet Bowl Brush	Option	Ea	186	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
GS	12	Rubbermaid #6310 Toilet Bowl Brush, 24/cs	Base	Ea	288	No Bid	No Bid	2.7800 800.64	No Bid	4.8700	1402.56		
	12.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #6310 Toilet Bowl Brush	Option	Ea	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.8400 241.92	No Bid			
									each				
GS	13	Cling type bowl cleaner, 24 oz, 12/cs	Base	Oz	2,016	No Bid	0.0729 146.97	0.0500 86.40	0.0600 120.96	0.1900	383.04		
							32 oz, 12/cs	32 oz, 12/cs	32 oz, 12/cs				
GS, NM	14	Rochester Midland Bowl Tamer #118112 bowl cleaner, 2 oz; 12/cs	Base	Oz	552	No Bid	0.1927 147.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	14.1	Alternate or Equal Rochester Midland Bowl Tamer #118112 bowl cleaner	Option	Oz	552	No Bid	No Bid	0.1000 55.20	0.0600 33.12	No Bid			
								32 oz, 12/cs	32 oz, 12/cs				
NM	15	Proline #BRU9008 Grout brush	Base	Ea	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	15.1	Alternate or Equal Proline #BRU9008 Grout brush	Option	Ea	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.7500 437.50	No Bid			

Dept	Line	Description	Type	UOM	Qty	QYK BRANDS LLC		The Home Depot Pro		General Chemical & Supply Inc.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Digital Dolphin Supplies	
NM	16	Weiler Brush Co #73055 Radiator Brush, or equal, black horsehair, 24" overall length, 7.5" brush part; 2.5" trim	Base	Ea	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	16.1	Alternate or Equal Weiler Brush Co #73055 Radiator Brush	Option	Ea	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		3.9300	7.86	No Bid	
DOC	17	Proline #BRU3410 Dual Surface Scrub Brush	Base	Ea	30	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	17.1	Alternate or Equal Dual Proline #BRU3410 Surface Scrub Brush	Option	Ea	30	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
DOC	18	Proline Counter Brush #BRU5308	Base	Ea	25	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	18.1	Alternate or Equal Proline Counter Brush #BRU5308	Option	Ea	25	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		4.3400	108.50	No Bid	
NM	19	Americo Mfg Octopus Scrubbing Pad #541020, 5/bag, 4 bags/bx	Base	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.6900	27.60	No Bid	
	19.1	Alternate or Equal Americo Mfg Octopus Scrubbing Pad #541020	Option	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
DOC	20	AmSan Renown #REN2117, Scrubbing Sponge, 20/cs	Base	Ea	2,500	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	20.1	Alternate or Equal AmSan Renown #REN2117 Scrubbing Sponge	Option	Ea	2,500	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.7300	1825.00	No Bid	
NM, YC	21	Scotch-Brite General Purpose 9"x6" Scouring Pad 96CC, 10/pkg	Base	Ea	100	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		1.2900	129.00
	21.1	Alternate or Equal Scotch-Brite General Purpose 9"x6" Scouring Pad 96CC	Option	Ea	100	No Bid		No Bid		0.1800	21.60	0.2100	21.00	No Bid	
													20/pkg		
GS, NM	22	Premiere Pads #PAD 174 Scrubbing Sponge, 20/cs	Base	Ea	320	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	22.1	Alternate or Equal Premiere Pads #PAD 174 Scrubbing Sponge	Option	Ea	320	No Bid		No Bid		0.6200	198.40	0.7300	233.60	No Bid	
													Alt 40/cs		
NM	23	Scotch-Brite Light Cleansing Hand Pad 7445, 20/cs	Base	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		1.1900	47.60	No Bid	
	23.1	Alternate or Equal Scotch-Brite Light Cleansing Hand Pad 7445	Option	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		0.5600	22.40	No Bid		No Bid	
													Alt 40/cs		
NM	24	Tide HE Laundry Detergent Powder; 143 oz bx	Base	Oz	429	No Bid		No Bid		0.2200	125.84	No Bid		No Bid	
	24.1	Alternate or Equal Tide HE Laundry Detergent Powder	Option	Oz	429	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.2600	111.54	0.3500	150.15
													95 oz/bx, 3 bx/cs		
NM	25	Ultra Downy Liquid Fabric Softener, April Fresh Scent, 103 oz btl	Base	Oz	103	No Bid		No Bid		0.1200	61.92	No Bid		No Bid	
	25.1	Alternate or Equal Ultra Downy Liquid Fabric Softener	Option	Oz	103	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0600	6.18	No Bid	
													64 oz, 8/cs		
No Award															
NM	26	Deb Aero Instant free-stand hand sanitizer, MFR #SBS55857, 1 liter, 6/cs	Base	Lt	90	No Bid		7.5300	677.70	No Bid		7.4500	670.50	No Bid	
	26.1	Alternate or Equal Deb Aero Instant free-stand hand sanitizer, MFR #SBS55857	Option	Lt	90	7.0000	630.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
													1 ltr, 20/cs		
No Award															
PK	27	Simoniz Almond Pearl Liquid Hand Soap, #CS0215004, 1 gal Btl, 4/cs	Base	Gal	8	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	27.1	Alternate or Equal Simoniz Almond Pearl Liquid Hand Soap, #CS0215004	Option	Gal	8	No Bid		No Bid		4.9800	39.84	5.5700	44.56	No Bid	
YC, PK	28	Simoniz #11750800, alcohol hand sanitizer gel Bag-in-Box, 800-ml Refill for wall dispenser, 6/cs	Base	ml	38,400	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	28.1	Alternate or Equal Simoniz #11750800, alcohol hand sanitizer gel	Option	ml	38,400	No Bid		0.1279	5116.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
													1000 ml, 8/cs		
No Award															

Dept	Line	Description	Type	UOM	Qty	QYK BRANDS LLC		The Home Depot Pro		General Chemical & Supply Inc.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Digital Dolphin Supplies	
NM	29	Franklin Furniture Polish #REN05003-AM, 18 oz aerosol cans, 12/cs	Base	Oz	216	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	29.1	Alternate or Equal Franklin Furniture Polish #REN05003-AM	Option	Oz	216	No Bid		No Bid		0.1400	28.56	0.1500	32.40	0.3200	69.12
										17 oz, 12/cs		19 oz, 12/cs			
No Award															
NM	30	Whittaker Crystal Red Stain Plus, Coffee and red stain spotter RTU, 12 oz, 12/cs	Base	Oz	144	No Bid		No Bid		34.3200	4942.08	No Bid		No Bid	
	30.1	Alternate or Equal Whittaker Crystal Red Stain Plus	Option	Oz	144	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.8656	124.65	No Bid	
												32 oz ea			
No Award															
NM, YC	31	3M #14002 Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish, 21 oz can, 12/cs	Base	Oz	504	No Bid		No Bid		0.6300	317.52	No Bid		0.9600	483.84
	31.1	Alternate or Equal 3M #14002 Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish	Option	Oz	504	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.4400	168.96	No Bid	
											16 oz, 6/cs				
NM	32	Pumie Scouring Stick, UPM12, 12/cs	Base	Ea	36	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		2.2500	81.00	3.3500	120.60
	32.1	Alternate or Equal Pumie Scouring Stick UPM12	Option	Ea	36	No Bid		No Bid		2.0800	74.88	No Bid		No Bid	
DOC	33	Amsan Renown #REN03947, Sweep Broom 24"	Base	Ea	50	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	33.1	Alternate or Equal Amsan Renown #REN03947	Option	Ea	50	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		8.1000	405.00	No Bid	
NM, DOC	34	Proline Brush #BRU136 Broom Handle, 12/cs	Base	Ea	972	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	34.1	Alternate or Equal Proline Brush #BRU136 Broom Handle	Option	Ea	972	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		2.4000	2332.80	No Bid	
											each				
GS, NM, DOC	35	Rubbermaid #6374 Lobby Dust Pan Broom	Base	Ea	19	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		14.1600	269.04
	35.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #6374 Lobby Dust Pan Broom	Option	Ea	19	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		3.6900	70.11	No Bid	
GS, NM	36	Rubbermaid #2531 Lobby Dust Pan	Base	Ea	11	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		37.1400	408.54
	36.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #2531 Lobby Dust Pan	Option	Ea	11	No Bid		No Bid		7.4500	81.95	8.4000	92.40	No Bid	
DOC	37	Rubbermaid #2005 Dust Pan heavy duty	Base	Ea	20	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		2.8400	56.80	8.4700	169.40
	37.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #2005 Dust Pan	Option	Ea	20	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
DOC	38	Unisan UNS 1200L, Mop Head 12/cs	Base	Ea	1,200	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	38.1	Alternate or Equal Unisan UNS 1200L Mop Head	Option	Ea	1,200	No Bid		7.4200	8904.00	4.2300	5076.00	1.2800	1536.00	No Bid	
DOC	39	Rubbermaid Gripper #H235 Wet Mop Handle, aluminum, 12/cs	Base	Ea	120	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	39.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid Gripper #H235 Wet Mop Handle	Option	Ea	120	No Bid		No Bid		19.9200	2390.40	13.9300	1671.60	No Bid	
											each				
DOC	40	Spartan iShine, SPA #4055, 5 gal pail	Base	Gal	30	No Bid		16.2400	487.20	88.9000	2667.00	15.3100	459.30	No Bid	
	40.1	Alterate or Equal Spartan iShine, SPA #4055	Option	Gal	30	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	41	Solar Salt, American Salt, 50 lb bag	Base	LB	7,500	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	41.1	Alternate or Equal Solar Salt, American Salt	Option	LB	7,500	No Bid		0.1500	1125.00	0.1800	1350.00	0.1890	1417.50	No Bid	
											40 lb bag				
YC	42	Sparclean Delimer #SPA7655, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	Gal	24	No Bid		11.7900	282.96	18.4700	443.28	9.7800	234.72	No Bid	
	42.2	Alternate or Equal Sparclean Delimer #SPA7655	Option	Gal	24	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	43	Mr Muscle Oven/Grill Cleaner #JDB91206, 19 oz aerosol, 6/cs	Base	Oz	114	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	43.1	Alternate or Equal Mr Muscle Oven/Grill Cleaner #JDB91206	Option	Oz	114	No Bid		No Bid		0.1300	28.08	0.1800	20.52	No Bid	
										12/cs		20 oz, 12/cs			

Dept	Line	Description	Type	UOM	Qty	QYK BRANDS LLC		The Home Depot Pro		General Chemical & Supply Inc.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Digital Dolphin Supplies	
YC	44	Penetrol Dish Soap for Restaurant, #REN02765-MS, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	Gal	8	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	44.1	Alternate or Equal Penetrol Dish Soap for Restaurant, #REN02765-MS	Option	Gal	8	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		9.5000	76.00	No Bid	
YC	45	Sparton Clean on the Go, Clean by Peroxy, #482002, 2 liter btl, 4/cs	Base	Lt	48	No Bid		16.9900	815.52	No Bid		7.3500	352.80	No Bid	
		Dilution Rate						256.128				1:128			
		Cost of Product at Dilution Rate						33.9800				0.0574			
	45.1	Alternate or Equal Sparton Clean on the Go, Clean by Peroxy, #482002	Option	Lt	48	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	46	Saniwipe Surface Sanitizing Wiper, NPPQ94384, 100 wipes/cntr, 6 cntr/cs	Base	Ea	12,000	No Bid		No Bid		0.1350	1620.00	0.5150	6180.00	No Bid	
	46.1	Alternate or Equal Saniwipe Surface Sanitizing Wiper, NPPQ94384	Option	Ea	12,000	0.0450	540.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	47	Spartan #319503 Sani-Tyze sanitizer ready to use food contact surface sanitizer; 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	Oz	768	No Bid		0.0673	51.69	0.0800	61.44	0.1050	80.64	No Bid	
	47.1	Alternate or Equal Spartan #319503 Sani-Tyze sanitizer	Option	Oz	768	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	48	3M 200CC 4"x5 1/2" Scotch-Brite Griddle Screen, 20/pk	Base	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	48.1	Alternate or Equal 3M 200CC 4"x5 1/2" Scotch-Brite Griddle Screen	Option	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.1450	5.80	No Bid	
													each		
YC	49	Bob Barker #Z516 Cold Water Soluble Bags, 100/cs	Base	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	49.1	Alternate or Equal Bob Barker #Z516 Cold Water Soluble Bags	Option	Ea	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	50	Rational 56.00.210A cleaner tabs for self-cooking center Combi Ovens, 100/cs	Base	Ea	900	No Bid		No Bid		1.8900	1701.00	0.9370	843.30	No Bid	
	50.1	Alternate or Equal Rational 56.00.210A cleaner tabs	Option	Ea	900	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
YC	51	Rational 56.00.562 Care Tabs for self-cooking center Combi Ovens with care controls, 150/cs	Base	Ea	450	No Bid		No Bid		1.2300	553.50	0.6510	292.95	No Bid	
	51.1	Alternate or Equal Rational 56.00.562 Care Tabs	Option	Ea	450	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
NM	52	Plastic Spray Bottle; 32 oz translucent with graduations	Base	Ea	30	No Bid		No Bid		0.6300	18.90	0.7900	23.70	1.2200	36.60
GS, NM, DOC, YC	53	Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz spray bottle; adjustable polyethylene spray trigger w/ nylon filter; chemical resistant heavy duty w/ viton seal, Must fit item #52	Base	Ea	411	No Bid		No Bid		1.6900	694.59	0.7400	304.14	2.5900	1064.49
										2.3200		1.5300			
NM, DOC	54	Spray bottle, Unisan #UNS 32	Base	Ea	80	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	55	Unisan #UNS 922-9 Trigger Sprayer, 9.5", for 32 oz spray bottle, Must fit item #54 (Base	Ea	265	No Bid		No Bid		2.6900	712.85	No Bid		No Bid	
	54.1	Alternate or Equal Spray bottle, Unisan #UNS 32	Option	Ea	80	No Bid		No Bid		1.6900	135.20	0.7900	63.20	No Bid	
	55.1	Alternate or Equal Unisan #UNS 922-9 Trigger Sprayer, Must fit item #54.1	Option	Ea	265	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.7400	196.10	No Bid	
GS, DOC	56	Rubbermaid #6277-77 Floor Sign, 6/cs	Base	Ea	48	No Bid		No Bid		38.1600	1831.68	30.8600	1481.28	59.6800	2864.64
	56.1	Alternate or Equal Rubbermaid #6277-77 Floor sign	Option	Ea	48	No Bid		36.1700	1736.16	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
								each							
GS, NM	57	Swiffer Duster Refill #PGC41767, 10/bx, 6 bx/cs	Base	Ea	780	No Bid		No Bid		0.9300	725.40	0.2310	180.18	No Bid	
	57.1	Alternate or Equal Swiffer Duster Refill #PGC41767	Option	Ea	780	No Bid		No Bid			40/cs	No Bid		No Bid	
GS,	58	Hospesco Wax Bag for Sanitary Napkin Disposal, 500/cs	Base	Ea	3,500	No Bid		0.0297	103.95	0.0490	171.50	0.0318	111.30	No Bid	

