

One-Year Contract for Disposable Wipes; Spec #74-12/22					
Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.					
No.	1	1.1	2	2.1	
Description	WipesPlus Hand Sanitizing Wipes, Progressive Products Item #33804 (Enter cost for one wipe)	Alternate or Equal Hand Sanitizing Wipes (The manufacturer, item #, packaging and case count size must be noted in the "Comment" area.)	WipesPlus Disinfecting Wipes, Progressive Products Item #33900 (Enter cost for one wipe)	Alternate or Equal Disinfecting Wipes (The manufacturer, item #, packaging and case count size must be noted in the "Comment" area.)	Total Extended
Type	Base	Option	Base	Option	
UOM	Ea	Ea	Ea	Ea	
Quantity	829,440.00	829,440.00	829,440.00	829,440.00	
BARUPON L. L. C.	No Bid	0.0122	No Bid	0.0122	
		10,119.1680		10,119.1680	\$20,238.34
DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0313	
				25,961.4720	\$25,961.47
CATALYST PR INC	No Bid	0.0250	No Bid	0.0300	
		20,736.0000		24,883.2000	\$45,619.20
SITA BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC	No Bid	0.0299	No Bid	0.0299	
		24,800.2560		24,800.2560	\$49,600.51
Medline Industries, Inc.	No Bid	0.0318	No Bid	0.0286	
		26,376.1920		23,721.9840	\$50,098.18
United Sales Usa Corp.	0.0345	No Bid	0.0285	No Bid	
	28,615.6800		23,639.0400		\$52,254.72
Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC	0.0305	No Bid	0.0406	No Bid	
	25,297.9200		33,675.2640		\$58,973.18
TRUSTED & DEPENDABLE SOLUTIONS LLC	No Bid	0.0300	No Bid	0.0500	
		24,883.2000		41,472.0000	\$66,355.20
Aida Enterprises	0.0397	No Bid	0.0438	No Bid	
	32,928.7680		36,329.4720		\$69,258.24
BlackGreyGold Solutions LLC	No Bid	0.0433	No Bid	0.0433	
		35,914.7520		35,914.7520	\$71,829.50
School Health Corporation	No Bid	0.0510	No Bid	0.0701	
		42,301.4400		58,143.7440	\$100,445.18
Encore Data Products, Inc.	No Bid	0.1917	No Bid	0.0556	
		159,003.6480		46,116.8640	\$205,120.51