

Contract for Tree Removal Services; Spec #66-11/22						
Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.						
All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening.						
No.	Description	Joseph McIlvaine Tree and Lawn	Davidheiser Construction Services	Knight Bros., Inc.	The Davey Tree Expert Company	Tree State Property Maintenance
1	Peace Valley Park South Side of Park (Creek Road) tree removal	No Bid	No Bid	\$164,372.72	\$355,680.00	No Bid
2	Peace Valley Park North Side of Park (New Galena Road) tree removal	No Bid	No Bid	\$159,461.76	\$346,230.00	No Bid
3	Tohickon Valley Park Cabin Rd from Parking Lot to Cabin #4 tree removal	No Bid	\$92,000.00	\$190,660.80	\$411,840.00	No Bid
4	Main Parking Area (Cafferty Rd) and Playground/Pavilion/Pool/Comfort Station	No Bid	\$19,000.00	\$68,753.44	\$149,760.00	No Bid
5	Tinicum Park tree removal	\$188,000.00	\$137,280.00	\$54,598.32	\$118,560.00	No Bid
6	Lake Towhee Park tree removal	No Bid	\$47,875.00	\$110,641.04	\$240,240.00	No Bid
7	Ringing Rocks Park tree removal	\$45,000.00	\$11,520.00	\$9,244.16	\$20,280.00	\$31,000.00
8	Buckwampum Mountain Tower Site tree removal	No Bid	No Bid	\$11,999.28	No Bid	No Bid
9	Churchville Nature Center tree removal	\$16,400.00	\$14,300.00	\$3,755.44	\$9,360.00	\$18,600.00
10	Silver Lake Park tree removal	\$32,000.00	\$17,100.00	\$5,488.72	\$12,480.00	\$24,800.00
11	Core Creek Park tree removal	\$105,000.00	\$81,900.00	\$26,288.08	\$59,280.00	\$55,800.00
12	Delaware Access Park tree removal	\$3,500.00	No Bid	\$3,755.44	\$8,112.00	\$6,200.00
13	Playwicki Park tree removal	\$10,000.00	\$10,500.00	\$2,888.80	\$6,240.00	\$12,400.00