One-Year Contract to Provide Plastic Utensils, Cups & Other Non-Food Kitchen Items.2; Spec #47-08/22

Description

Type

uom

Quantity

Concordance Healthcare

WB Mason Company

Imperial Bag & Paper Co.,

11400 Inc.

Solutions LLC
Container, Dart 46, foam, 4 oz squat white,
10/50/pke, 20 pkg/cs Base |Ea 30,000.00 No Bid 0.0600  1,800.00 0.0986 | 2,958.00 94.4900 ‘ 2,834,700.00
10.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 30,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Container, Dart 85J12, foam, 8 oz squat, white,
20/50/pkg, 20 pkg/cs Base |Ea 10,000.00| 0.0722 722.00 0.0900 ‘ 900.00 0.1370 1,370.00 66.7400 ‘ 667,400.00
20.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cups, Dart #DCC8J8, 8 oz. foam, 25/sleeve, 40
30| sleeves/cs Base |Ea 132,000.00 0.0618 8,157.60 0.0600  7,920.00 0.0839 11,074.80 66.7400 ‘ 8,809,680.00
30.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 132,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lids for above 8 oz. Cups, Dart #DCC8SL, X straw
31/slot, 25/sleeve, 40 sleeves/cs Base Ea 32,000.00 0.0204 652.80 0.0400 ‘ 1,280.00 0.0699 2,236.80 49.4900 ‘ 1,583,680.00
31.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 32,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cups, Dart #DCC16J16, 16 oz. foam, 25/sleeve, 40
40|sleeves/cs Base Ea 172,000.00] 0.1114 19,160.80 0.1200 ‘ 20,640.00 0.1743 29,979.60 119.9900 ‘ 20,638,280.00
40.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 172,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lids for above 16 oz. Cups, Dart #DCC16SL, white,
41 X straw slot, 25/sleeve, 40 sleeves/cs Base Ea 150,000.00 0.0350 5,250.00 0.0600 ‘ 9,000.00 0.0798 11,970.00 60.7400 ‘ 9,111,000.00
41.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 150,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cup, Dart #5N25, 5 oz., plastic, translucent,
50/2400/cs Base |Ea 9,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 9,600.00| 0.0238 228.48 0.0240 \ 230.40 0.0331 \ 317.76 73.4900 705,504.00
Medicine Cup, Merit #ME-GMPP1I, T oz, clear
polypropylene, medicine graduations clearly
60 marked, 100/sleeve, 50 sleeves/cs Base Ea 340,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.4900 18,866,600.00
60.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 340,000.00 0.0148 5,032.00 0.0140 4,760.00 0.0148 ‘ 5,032.00 No Bid
Paper Soufflé Cup, Dart #100-2050, or equal, 1 oz,
70/250/bx, 20 bx/cs Base |Ea 50,000.00 0.0213 1,065.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
70.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 50,000.00 No Bid 0.0100 500.00 0.0157 ‘ 785.00 86.9900 ‘ 4,349,500.00
Plastic Soufflé Portion cup, Crystal Ware
80| #CSWPC2C25100, clear, 2 oz, 200/pkg, 12 pkg/cs |Base Ea 48,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80.1  ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 48,000.00 0.0479 2,299.20 0.0140 672.00 0.0239 ‘ 1,147.20 55.4900 ‘ 2,663,520.00
Tids for above Plastic Souffle Portion Cup, Crystal
Ware #CSWLPCM25100, flat, clear portion, 2 oz,
81)100/pke, 24 pke/cs Base |Ea 48,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 48,000.00 No Bid 0.0130 624.00 0.0224 1,075.20 41.9900 ‘ 2,015,520.00
Plate, AJIM 073103, or equal, paper, 9", white,
grease resistant, medium weight, 100/pk, 10
90| pks/cs Base |Ea 60,000.00 No Bid No Bid 0.0427 2,562.00 No Bid
90.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 60,000.00 No Bid 0.0400 2,400.00 No Bid 47.9900 ‘ 2,879,400.00
Plate, Green Wave International #TW-FOP-009, or
100/ equal, 8.5”, 1 compartment, 125/Bag, 4 Bag/cs Base Ea 35,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 35,000.00 No Bid 0.0760 2,660.00 0.1188 ‘ 4,158.00 132.7400 4,645,900.00
Plate, Dart Concorde #CPWCR, foam, 6", 1
110 compartment, white, round, 1000/cs Base Ea 20,000.00 No Bid 0.0600 1,200.00 No Bid 108.7400 2,174,800.00
110.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 20,000.00 No Bid No Bid 0.0635 ‘ 1,270.00 No Bid
Bowl, GenPak #344101, foam, 12 oz, white,
120/ laminated, 125/pkg, 8 pkg/cs Base Ea 25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 98.2400 2,456,000.00
120.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 25,000.00 No Bid 0.0500  1,250.00 0.0737 \ 1,842.50 No Bid
Tray, Spring Grove #4279470, or equal,
paperboard food tray, .5 Ib clay coated, white &
130|red checkered, 250/slv, 4 slv/ctn Base Ea 50,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
130.1/ ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 50,000.00 No Bid 0.0400  2,000.00 0.0519 \ 2,595.00 56.9900 \ 2,849,500.00
Napkin, Crystal Ware #LN12500, or equal,
luncheon white, 18”L x 12” W x 18.5"H, 1 ply,
140/500/pkg, 12 pkg/cs Base Ea 180,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 180,000.00 No Bid 0.0070  1,260.00 0.0248 \ 4,464.00 38.2400 \ 6,883,200.00
Fork, Crystal Ware #FPPWP1000, or equal,
medium weight, white, polypropylene bulk
150 | plastic, 1000/cs Base Ea 75,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 75,000.00 0.0535 4,012.50 0.0100 750.00 0.0169 \ 1,267.50 11.8400 \ 888,000.00
Spoon, tea, Crystal Ware #TSPPWPI000, or equal,
medium weight, white, polypropylene bulk
160 | plastic, 1000/cs Base Ea 303,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
160.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 303,000.00 No Bid 0.0100  3,030.00 0.0162 \ 4,908.60 11.8400 \ 3,587,520.00
Spoon, soup, Crystal Ware #SSPPWPI000, or
equal medium weight, white, polypropylene bulk
170 | plastic, 1000/cs Base Ea 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
170.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 1,000.00 No Bid 0.0100 10.00 0.0162 \ 16.20 11.8400 \ 11,840.00
Knife, Crystal Ware #KNPPWI000, or equal,
medium weight, white, polypropylene bulk
180 | plastic, 1000/cs Base Ea 75,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 75,000.00 0.0535 \ 5,250.00 0.0100 750.00 0.0162 \ 1,215.00 11.8400 \ 888,000.00
Straws, Crystal Ware #SFPPIWR25400, Flexible,
190 Clear, Wrapped 7 %” Long, 25/pkg, 400 pkg/cs Base Ea 160,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
190.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Base |Ea 160,000.00 0.1112 ‘ 17,792.00 0.0070 1,120.00 0.0142 2,272.00 91.4900 | 14,638,400.00
200|Aluminum Foil, 18" x 1000', standard Base Ea 5 No Bid 24.6500 123.25 87.6700 438.35 59.9900 299.95
210|Plastic Film Wrap, 18" x 2000 Base |Ea 15 No Bid 22.7500 341.25 24.5000 367.50 24.7400 371.10




Parchment Paper, sheet pan size approx 16 3/8" x
220(24 3/8", 1000 sheets/cs Base |Ea 4,000.00 ‘ 0.0400 160.00 0.0999 399.60 53.9900 215,960.00
Pan Liner, Elkay Plastics #PL3418, 6” x 34" x 18”,
230(50/cs Base Ea 500 No Bid No Bid 1.4900 745.00 No Bid
230.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid 126.7400 63,370.00
Foil Steam Table Pan Disposable, Full pan (med),
240|12” x 20” x 24", 50/cs Base Ea 100 No Bid 1.6600 166.00 3.3500 335.00 78.7400 7,874.00
Plastic storage bags, Ziploc , Gallon size, zip
250 closure, 250 bgs/cs Base Ea 500 0.1264 63.20 No Bid 0.2860 143.00 No Bid
250.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 500 No Bid 0.0900 45.00 No Bid 27.7400 ‘ 13,870.00
Plastic storage bags, Ziploc , Quart size, zip
260 closure, 500 bgs/cs Base Ea 5,000.00 No Bid No Bid 0.0680 340.00 No Bid
260.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 5,000.00 No Bid 0.0420 210.00 No Bid 29.9900 \ 149,950.00
Disposable, Half-Size Deep Light-Weight
Aluminum Steam Table, Silver, Pactiv #Y6132L,
270/12.75” X 10.375” X 2.5625”, 100/cs Base Ea 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
270.1| ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT Option |Ea 600 No Bid 0.3100 186.00 0.6285 377.10 57.7400 \ 34,644.00
Total Extended| $ 26,014.08 | S 32,317.50 | $ 3,802.00
Low Bid
|Awarded




